H5226

colleagues to support strict immigra-
tion reform in the interest of national
security.

——
SECURE THE BORDERS FIRST

(Mrs. BLACKBURN asked and was
given permission to address the House
for 1 minute and to revise and extend
her remarks.)

Mrs. BLACKBURN. Mr. Speaker, we
are seeing it everywhere we go and we
are hearing it from all of our constitu-
ents every time we go home, every
time we hold a town hall meeting, and
every time we show up in a local com-
munity: illegal entry into this country
and the presence of those who have
made a decision to break the law to
come here.

Illegal immigration is an issue to be
addressed, and here it is on the front
page of The Washington Post. Twelve
hundred miles from the border, U.S.
border town, yes, indeed, by those indi-
viduals who would choose to enter the
country illegally. Every town has be-
come a border town and every State
has become a border State.

I encourage our colleagues to hang
tough in this debate and stay with the
House bill where we secure the border
first.

———————

ANNOUNCEMENT BY THE SPEAKER
PRO TEMPORE

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 8 of rule XX, the Chair
will postpone further proceedings
today on motions to suspend the rules
on which a recorded vote or the yeas
and nays are ordered, or on which the
vote is objected to under clause 6 of
rule XX.

Record votes on postponed questions
will be taken after 6:30 p.m. today.

———

MARINE MAMMAL PROTECTION
ACT AMENDMENTS OF 2006

Mr. RENZI. Mr. Speaker, I move to
suspend the rules and pass the bill
(H.R. 4075) to amend the Marine Mam-
mal Protection Act of 1972 to provide
for better understanding and protec-
tion of marine mammals, and for other
purposes, as amended.

The Clerk read as follows:

H.R. 4075

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘Marine
Mammal Protection Act Amendments of
2006”’.

SEC. 2. AMENDMENT REFERENCES.

Except as otherwise expressly provided,
whenever in this Act an amendment or re-
peal is expressed in terms of an amendment
to, or repeal of, a section or other provision,
the reference shall be considered to be made
to such section or other provision of the Ma-
rine Mammal Protection Act of 1972 (16
U.S.C. 1361 et seq.).

SEC. 3. TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.

(a) COMMITTEE REFERENCES.—The Marine

Mammal Protection Act of 1972 (16 U.S.C.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

1361 et seq.) is amended by striking ‘‘Com-
mittee on Merchant Marine and Fisheries”
each place it appears and inserting ‘‘Com-
mittee on Resources’.

(b) OBSOLETE REFERENCE TO SECTION.—Sec-
tion 118(c)(3)(A)(1) (16 U.S.C. 1387(c)(3)(A)(1))
is amended by striking *‘, except that” and
all that follows through ‘‘is valid”.

SEC. 4. LIMITED AUTHORITY TO EXPORT MARINE

MAMMAL PRODUCTS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 101(a)(6) (16
U.S.C. 1371(a)(6)) is amended by redesig-

nating subparagraph (B) as subparagraph (C),
and by inserting after subparagraph (A) the
following:

‘(B) A marine mammal product may be ex-
ported from the United States if the prod-
uct—

‘(1) is legally possessed, and exported by, a
citizen of the United States for noncommer-
cial purposes in conjunction with travel out-
side the United States and the product is im-
ported into the United States by the same
person upon the termination of travel;

‘“(ii) is legally possessed, and exported by,
a person that is not a citizen of the United
States for noncommercial purposes;

“(iii) is legally possessed and exported as
part of a cultural exchange, by an Indian,
Aleut, or Eskimo residing in Alaska; or

“(v) is owned by a Native inhabitant of
Russia, Canada, or Greenland and is exported
for noncommercial purposes—

‘() in conjunction with, and upon the
completion of, travel within the TUnited
States; or

“(II) as part of a cultural exchange with an
Indian, Aleut, or Eskimo residing in Alas-
ka.”.

(b) CONFORMING  AMENDMENT.—Section
101(a)(6)(A)(@) (16 U.S.C. 1371(a)(6)(A)(1)) is
amended by inserting ‘‘for noncommercial
purposes’ after ‘‘United States” the first
place it appears.

SEC. 5. CAPTIVE RELEASE PROHIBITION.

Section 102(a) (16 U.S.C. 1372(a)) is amend-
ed—

(1) in paragraph (4) by striking ‘‘subsection
104(c); and”’ and inserting ‘‘section 104(c);”’;

(2) in paragraph (5) by striking the period
and inserting ‘‘; and’’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

‘“(6) for any person that is subject to the
jurisdiction of the United States to release
any captive marine mammal unless specifi-
cally authorized to do so under section
104(c)(3)(A), 104(c)(4)(A), or 109(h), except that
this paragraph shall not apply to the tem-
porary release of any marine mammal that
is maintained in captivity under section 7524
of title 10, United States Code (including any
progeny of a marine mammal maintained
under that section).”.

SEC. 6. ANNUAL REPORT REQUIREMENT.

Section 103(f) (16 U.S.C. 1373(f)) is amended
in the first sentence, by inserting ‘‘and not-
withstanding Public Law 104-66° after
“thereafter’.

SEC. 7. PERMIT CLARIFICATIONS.

(a) CLARIFICATIONS.—Section 104 (16 U.S.C.
1374) is amended as follows:

(1) Subsection (c¢)(7) is amended by insert-
ing ‘“‘notwithstanding any other provision of
law’’ after ‘‘requesting the permit’’.

(2) Subsection (¢)(9) is amended to read as
follows:

‘(99 (A) No marine mammal may be ex-
ported—

‘(i) for the purpose of public display, un-
less the Secretary of Agriculture evaluates
and verifies, and thereafter notifies the Sec-
retary, that the receiving facility meets
standards that are comparable to the re-
quirements that a person must meet to re-
ceive a permit under this subsection for that
purpose; or

‘“(i1) for the purpose of scientific research
or enhancing the survival or recovery of a

July 17, 2006

species or stock, unless the receiving facility
meets standards that are comparable to the
requirements that a person must meet to re-
ceive a permit under this subsection for that
purpose.

‘“(B) The Secretary may not require or re-
quest, through comity or any other means,
that any marine mammal or its progeny re-
main subject to the jurisdiction of the
United States when located in waters or on
lands that are subject to the jurisdiction of
another country.”.

(3) Subsection (¢)(10) is amended—

(A) in the first sentence by inserting ‘‘held
within the lands and waters of the United
States’ after “marine mammals’ each place
it appears;

(B) by inserting after the first sentence the
following: ‘“The Secretary shall update the
inventory on an annual basis.”’; and

(C) in subparagraph (D) by inserting ‘‘own-
ership, or other’ after ‘‘date of”’.

(b) REVIEW AND REPORT REGARDING INVEN-
TORY.—

(1) REVIEW.—The Secretaries of Commerce
and the Interior shall, by not later than 12
months after date of the enactment of this
Act, jointly conduct a review of the inven-
tory maintained under section 104(c)(10) of
the Marine Mammal Protection Act of 1972
(16 U.S.C. 1374(c)(10)), the use of the informa-
tion in the inventory, and the costs, benefits,
and issues associated with the development
of an online inventory.

(2) CONSULTATION.—In conducting the re-
view, the Secretary shall consult and solicit
input from persons who are required to pro-
vide information for the inventory.

(3) REPORT.—The Secretary shall submit a
report to Committee on Resources of the
House of Representatives and the Committee
on Commerce, Science, and Transportation
of the Senate on the findings of the review
under this subsection. The report shall in-
clude the following:

(A) Recommendations on whether the in-
ventory should be maintained by the Sec-
retary or by another person under contract.

(B) How the Secretary would oversee main-
tenance of the inventory carried out under
contract.

(C) How public access and access by Fed-
eral agencies to the inventory can be main-
tained if the inventory is maintained under
contract.

(D) How the Secretary can minimize dupli-
cation on the information the Secretary re-
ceives from public display facilities and re-
duce the paper work burden on those facili-
ties.

(E) An estimate of the cost of maintaining
the inventory.

(F) A description of how the Secretary will
ensure the secure maintenance of the data in
the inventory.

(G) An analysis of the potential that online
availability of the information in the inven-
tory could adversely affect the safety of the
animals.

(¢) LIMITATION ON NOTIFICATION REQUIRE-
MENTS.—Section 104(c) (16 U.S.C. 1374(c)) is
amended in paragraph (2)(E) in the first sen-
tence, and in paragraph (8)(B)(i)(II), by in-
serting before the period at the end the fol-
lowing: *‘, except that if the transport is for
purposes of public display and the transfer is
between facilities where the ownership and
care of the marine mammal will be under the
same license or registration issued under the
Animal Welfare Act (7 U.S.C. 2131 et seq.)
then only a notice of transport is required’.
SEC. 8. FINES AND PENALTIES.

(a) FINES AND PENALTIES, GENERALLY.—
Section 105 (16 U.S.C. 1375) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a)(1) by striking *“$10,000’
and inserting ‘‘$20,000’’; and

(2) in subsection (b) by striking ‘$20,000"’
and inserting ‘“$30,000"".



July 17, 2006

(b) VESSEL PENALTY.—Section 106(b) (16
U.S.C. 1376(b)) is amended by striking
¢‘$25,000”’ and inserting ‘‘$35,000"".

SEC. 9. MARINE MAMMAL GRANTS.

Section 110(a) (16 U.S.C. 1380(a)) is amended
to read as follows:

‘“(a) AUTHORIZATION OF ASSISTANCE; AN-
NUAL REPORT.—

‘(1) AUTHORIZATION OF ASSISTANCE.—The
Secretary may make grants, or provide fi-
nancial assistance in such other form as the
Secretary considers appropriate, to any Fed-
eral or State agency, public or private insti-
tution, or other person for the purpose of as-
sisting such agency, institution, or person to
undertake research in subjects that are rel-
evant to the protection and conservation of
marine mammals.

“(2) REPORTS.—

‘““(A) REPORTS BY SECRETARY.—The Sec-
retary shall include a description of the re-
sults of research carried out with assistance
under this section in the annual report re-
quired under section 103(f).

‘“(B) REPORTS BY FEDERAL AGENCIES.—The
head of each Federal agency that conducts
and provides funds for research on marine
mammals shall report annually to the Com-
mittee on Resources of the House of Rep-
resentatives and the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation of the
Senate on funding provided and research
conducted regarding marine mammals dur-
ing the preceding year.

‘“(3) CONTRIBUTIONS.—For purposes of car-
rying out this section, the Secretary may ac-
cept, solicit, receive, hold, administer, and
use gifts, devises, and bequests.”.

SEC. 10. FISHERIES GEAR DEVELOPMENT.

Section 111 (16 U.S.C. 1381) is amended as
follows:

(1) Subsection (a) is amended to read as
follows:

‘“(a) FISHING GEAR DEVELOPMENT PRO-
GRAM.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Com-
merce (in this section referred to as the ‘Sec-
retary’) shall—

““(A) carry out a program for the purpose of
devising improved fishing gear and methods
so as to reduce to the maximum extent prac-
ticable the incidental taking of marine
mammals in connection with fishing oper-
ations; and

‘(B) make every practicable effort to de-
velop, evaluate, and make available to own-
ers and operators of fishing vessels such gear
and fishing method improvements as quickly
as possible.

¢‘(2) COORDINATION WITH OTHER COUNTRIES.—
The Secretary may coordinate with other
countries to foster gear technology transfer
initiatives to reduce to the maximum extent
practicable the incidental mortality and se-
rious injury of marine mammals throughout
the full extent of their range.”.

(2) By adding at the end the following:

‘“(e) GEAR IMPROVEMENT MINI-GRANT PRO-
GRAM.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—Subject to the avail-
ability of appropriations, the Secretary may
establish a grant program to provide finan-
cial assistance for developing, manufac-
turing, testing, or designing new types of
fishing gear designed to reduce to the max-
imum extent practicable the incidental tak-
ing (including incidental mortality and seri-
ous injury) of marine mammals.

‘(2) GRANT AMOUNT AND PURPOSES.—The
amount of a grant under this subsection may
not exceed $20,000.

‘“(3) GRANT APPLICATIONS.—To receive a
grant under this section, an applicant must
submit an application in such form and man-
ner as the Secretary may prescribe.

‘“(4) CONSULTATION REGARDING CRITERIA.—
The Secretary shall consult with the Sec-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

retary of the Interior and the Marine Mam-
mal Commission regarding the development
of criteria for the awarding of grants under
this subsection.

“(5) ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS.—Of amounts
available each fiscal year to carry out this
subsection, the Secretary may expend not
more than $40,000 to pay the administrative
expenses necessary to carry out this sub-
section.

‘“(6) CONTRIBUTIONS.—For purposes of car-
rying out this section, the Secretary may ac-
cept, solicit, receive, hold, administer, and
use gifts, devises, and bequests.”’.

SEC. 11. CONFORMING AMENDMENT.

Subsection (c) of the Dolphin Protection
Consumer Information Act (16 U.S.C. 1385) is
amended in paragraph (2) by striking ‘160 de-
grees west longitude” and inserting ‘150 de-
grees west longitude”.

SEC. 12. TAKE REDUCTION PLANS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 118 (16 U.S.C.
1387) is amended as follows:

(1) In subsection (a) by striking ‘‘commer-
cial” each place it appears in paragraphs (1)
and (5).

(2) In subsection (¢)(1) by striking so much
as precedes subparagraph (B) and inserting
the following:

“‘(c) REGISTRATION AND AUTHORIZATION.—(1)
The Secretary shall, within 90 days after the
date of enactment of the Marine Mammal
Protection Act Amendments of 2006—

‘“(A) publish in the Federal Register for
public comment, for a period of not less than
90 days, any necessary changes to the Sec-
retary’s list of fisheries published under sec-
tion 114(b)(1) in the Federal Register on Au-
gust 24, 1994 (along with an explanation of
such changes and a statement describing the
marine mammal stocks interacting with,
and the approximate number of vessels or
persons actively involved in, each such fish-
ery), with respect to—

‘(i) commercial and recreational fisheries
that have frequent incidental mortality and
serious injury of marine mammals;

‘(i) commercial and recreational fisheries
that have occasional incidental mortality
and serious injury of marine mammals; or

‘“(iii) commercial fisheries that have a re-
mote likelihood of or no known incidental
mortality or serious injury of marine mam-
mals;”.

(3) In subsection (c)(1) in subparagraphs (B)
and (C) by striking ‘‘commercial’’.

(4) In subsection (c)(2)(A) by striking
‘“‘commercial’’.

(5) In subsection (¢)(3)(A) in the matter
preceding clause (i) by striking ‘‘a commer-
cial fishery’ and inserting ‘‘that fishery’’.

(6) In subsection (c)(3)(E) by inserting
‘“‘commercial’’ after ‘“‘any’’.

(7) In subsection (c)(6)(B) by striking
‘“‘commercial’’.

(8) In subsection (d)(1) in the matter pre-
ceding subparagraph (A) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fishing operations’” and inserting
‘“‘fishing operations in a fishery listed under
subsection (¢)(1)(A)(i) or (ii)”.

(9) In subsection (d)(3) in the matter pre-
ceding subparagraph (A) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fisheries’” and inserting ‘‘fisheries
listed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)({) or (ii)”’.

(10) In subsection (d)(4) as follows:

(A) In the matter preceding subparagraph
(A) by striking ‘‘commercial fisheries’ and
inserting ‘‘fisheries listed under subsection
(©)(M)(A)@) or (i1)”.

(B) In subparagraph (A) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fisheries’” and inserting ‘‘fisheries
listed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)(1) or (ii)”.

(C) In subparagraph (B) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fisheries’” and inserting ‘‘fisheries
listed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)(1) or (ii)”.

(D) In subparagraph (C) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fisheries’” and inserting ‘‘fisheries
listed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)(1) or (ii)”.

H5227

(11) In subsection (d)(5) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fishing operations” and inserting
“fishing operations in fisheries listed under
subsection (¢)(1)(A)() or (ii)”.

(12) In subsection (e) in the matter pre-
ceding paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking ‘‘commercial’ each place it
appears; and

(B) by striking ‘‘this Act” and inserting
“this section”.

(13) In subsection (f) by striking so much
as precedes paragraph (2) and inserting the
following:

“(f) TAKE REDUCTION PLANS.—(1) The Sec-
retary shall develop and implement a take
reduction plan designed to assist in the re-
covery or prevent the depletion of each stra-
tegic stock which interacts with a fishery
listed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)(i) or (ii), un-
less the Secretary determines, after notice
and opportunity for public comment, that
the level of fishery related mortality and se-
rious injury is having a negligible impact on
that stock. The Secretary may develop and
implement a take reduction plan for any
other marine mammal stocks which interact
with a fishery listed wunder subsection
(c)(1)(A)({) which the Secretary determines,
after notice and opportunity for public com-
ment, has a high level of mortality and seri-
ous injury across a number of such marine
mammal stocks.”.

(14) In subsection (f)(2)—

(A) by striking ‘6 months” and inserting
‘9 months’’; and

(B) by striking ‘‘commercial fishing oper-
ations” each place it appears and inserting
“fishing operations in fisheries listed under
subsection (¢)(1)(A)() or (ii)”.

(15) In subsection (f)(3) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial”’.

(16) In subsection ()(4)(B) by striking
‘“‘commercial fishing operations’ and insert-
ing ‘‘fishing operations in fisheries listed
under subsection (¢)(1)(A)@{A) or (ii)”.

(17) In subsection (f)(5)—

(A) in subparagraph (A) by striking ‘6
months” and inserting ‘‘9 months’’; and

(B) in subparagraphs (A) and (B) by strik-
ing ‘‘commercial” each place it appears.

(18) In subsection (f)(6)(A)—

(A) by striking ‘‘(not later than 30 days)’’;
and

(B) in clause (ii) by striking ‘‘commercial
fisheries’” and inserting ‘‘fisheries listed
under subsection (¢)(1)(A)() or (ii)”.

(19) In subsection (f)(6)(C) in the second
sentence, by inserting before ‘‘, and others”
the following: ‘‘, where appropriate a rep-
resentative of the office of General Counsel
of the National Oceanic and Atmospheric Ad-
ministration, a representative of the Na-
tional Marine Fisheries Service having re-
sponsibilities related to fisheries science, a
representative of the National Marine Fish-
eries Service having responsibilities related
to law enforcement, and a representative of
the appropriate National Marine Fisheries
Service Regional Administrator”.

(20) In subsection (f)(7)—

(A) in subparagraph (A)(i) by striking ‘6
months” and inserting ‘9 months’’;

(B) in subparagraph (B)(i)—

(1) by striking ‘‘not later than 60 days’ and
inserting ‘‘not later than 120 days’’; and

(ii) by adding at the end the following:
‘“Before publishing any plan that is different
than the draft plan proposed by a take reduc-
tion team, the Secretary shall reconvene the
team and explain to the team the differences
between the published plan and the draft
plan proposed by the team.”’; and

(C) in subparagraph (B)(ii)—

(i) by striking ‘6 months’’ and inserting ‘9
months’’; and

(ii) by striking ‘“‘not later than 8 months”’
and inserting ‘‘not later than 11 months”.



H5228

(21) In subsection (f)(7)(C) by striking ‘‘Not
later than 60 days’ and inserting ‘‘Not later
than 90 days’’.

(22) In subsection O (7T)(D) by striking
‘‘commercial”’.

(23) In subsection (f)(8)—

(A) in subparagraph (C) by striking ‘‘Not
later than 60 days’ and inserting ‘‘Not later
than 180 days’’; and

(B) by striking ‘‘commercial” each place it
appears.

(24) In subsection (f)(9) as follows:

(A) In subparagraph (A) by striking ‘“‘com-
mercial fisheries or restrict commercial fish-
eries’”” and inserting ‘‘fisheries listed under
subsection (c)(1)(A)(i) or (ii) or restrict such
fisheries™.

(B) In subparagraphs (B) and (C) by strik-
ing ‘“‘commercial’’ each place it appears.

(C) In subparagraph (D) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fishing operations” and inserting
“participation in a fishery listed under sub-
section (¢)(1)(A)({) or (ii)”.

(25) In subsection (g)(1) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fisheries’” and inserting ‘‘fisheries
listed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)@{) or (ii)”.

(26) In subsection (g2)(3)(B) by striking
‘“‘commercial’’.

(27) In subsection (g)(4) by striking ‘‘com-
mercial fishery’ and inserting ‘‘fishery list-
ed under subsection (¢)(1)(A)(i) or (ii)”.

(28) In subsection (j) by inserting ‘‘includ-
ing observer, research, and education and
outreach programs,’”’ after ‘“‘For purposes of
carrying out this section,”.

(29) By amending subsection (d)(1)(C) to
read as follows:

“(C) identify current fishery regulations
and changes in fishing methods or tech-
nology that may increase or decrease inci-
dental mortality and serious injury.”.

(30) In subsection (f)(2) in the last sentence
by inserting ‘‘conservation benefits of’’ be-
fore ‘‘State or regional fishery management
plans.”.

(31) By amending subsection (f)(4)(A) to
read as follows:

““(A) a review of the information in the
final stock assessment published under sec-
tion 117(b), any substantial new information,
a review of the conservation benefits from
current State and regional fishery manage-
ment regulations;”.

(b) STOCK ASSESSMENTS.—Section 117(a)(4)
is amended—

(1) by striking ‘‘and’ at the end of subpara-
graph (C);

(2) by inserting ‘‘and” at the end of sub-
paragraph (D); and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(E) potential conservation benefits pro-
vided by State and regional fishery manage-
ment regulations;”.

(c) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
101(a)(5)(E) (16 U.S.C. 1371(a)(5)(E)) is amend-
ed by inserting ‘‘or recreational’’ after ‘‘com-
mercial’ each place it appears.

SEC. 13. PINNIPED CONTROL PROGRAM.

Section 120 (16 U.S.C. 1389) is amended by
adding at the end the following:

“(k) NONLETHAL REMOVAL AND CONTROL.—
(1) The Secretary shall conduct a program on
the nonlethal removal and control of nui-
sance pinnipeds. The program shall include a
review of measures that have been taken to
effect such removal and control, the effec-
tiveness of these measures, and the develop-
ment of new technologies to deter nuisance
pinnipeds.

‘“(2) The Secretary shall include, among
the individuals that develop the program
under this subsection, representatives of the
commercial and recreational fishing indus-
tries and, as appropriate, individuals with
scientific proficiency, technical credentials,
and expertise.

‘“(3) The Secretary is encouraged, where
appropriate, to use independent marine

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

mammal research institutions in developing
and in conducting the program.

‘“(4) The Secretary shall, by December 31 of
each year, submit an annual report on the
results of research under this subsection to
the Committee on Resources of the House of
Representatives and the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation of the
Senate.

“(1) QUALIFIED
PROJECTS.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary may, to
the extent amounts are available to carry
out this subsection, provide a grant to any
eligible applicant to carry out a qualified
nonlethal control project in accordance with
this subsection.

¢(2) APPLICATIONS.—The Secretary shall—

‘“(A) publish guidelines for and solicit ap-
plications for grants under this subsection
not later than 6 months after the date of en-
actment of this subsection; and

‘“(B) receive, review, evaluate, and approve
applications for grants under this sub-
section.

‘(3) ELIGIBLE APPLICANT.—To be an eligible
applicant for purposes of paragraph (1), an
applicant must—

‘“(A) be a State, local government, or inter-
state or regional agency; and

‘“(B) have adequate personnel, funding, and
authority to carry out and monitor or main-
tain a nonlethal control of nuisance
pinnipeds project.

‘“(4) QUALIFIED CONTROL PROJECT.—To be a
qualified control project under this sub-
section, a project must—

‘“(A) by humane and nonlethal means, re-
move, deter, and control nuisance pinnipeds
in areas where they are a recurrent and per-
sistent threat to public health and safety;
and

‘(B) encourage public notice, education,
and outreach on project activities in the af-
fected community.

‘“(5) GRANT DURATION.—Each grant under
this subsection shall be to provide funding
for the Federal share of the cost of a project
carried out with the grant for up to 2 fiscal
years.

‘(6) REPORTING BY GRANTEE.—

‘“(A) IN GENERAL.—A grantee carrying out
a control project with a grant under this
subsection shall report to the Secretary at
the expiration of the grant.

‘(B) REPORT CONTENTS.—Each report under
this subsection shall include specific infor-
mation on the methods and techniques used
to control nuisance pinniped species in the
project area, and on the ensuing results.

““(7) COST SHARING.—

‘““(A) FEDERAL SHARE.—Except as provided
in paragraphs (2) and (3), the Federal share of
the cost of a project carried out with a grant
under this subsection shall not exceed 75 per-
cent of such cost.

“(B) APPLICATION OF IN-KIND CONTRIBU-
TIONS.—The Secretary may apply to the non-
Federal share of costs of a control project
carried out with a grant under this sub-
section the fair market value of services or
any other form of in-kind contribution to
the project made by non-Federal interests
that the Secretary determines to be an ap-
propriate contribution equivalent to the
monetary amount required for the non-Fed-
eral share of the activity.

‘(C) DERIVATION OF NON-FEDERAL SHARE.—
The non-Federal share of the cost of a con-
trol project carried out with a grant under
this subsection may not be derived from a
Federal grant program or other Federal
funds.

‘“(8) CLARIFICATION.—Nothing in this sub-
section shall be interpreted as suspending or
waiving any requirement under any other
provision of this Act.”.

NONLETHAL CONTROL

July 17, 2006

SEC. 14. MARINE MAMMAL COMMISSION.

(a) NUMBER OF EMPLOYEES.—Section 206(5)
(16 U.S.C. 1406(5)) is amended by striking
except that no fewer than 11 employees must
be employed under paragraph (1) at any
time”’.

(b) ADMINISTRATION.—Section 206 (16 U.S.C.
1406) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (4) by striking ‘(but at
rates for individuals not to exceed $100 per
diem)”’; and

(2) in paragraph (5) by striking ‘‘Financial”
and all that follows through the end of that
sentence.

SEC. 15. STRANDING AND ENTANGLEMENT RE-
SPONSE.

(a) COLLECTION AND UPDATING OF INFORMA-
TION.—Section 402(b)(1)(A) (16 U.s.C.
1421a(b)(1)(A)) is amended by inserting ‘‘or
entangled’ after ‘‘stranded’.

(b) ENTANGLEMENT RESPONSE
MENTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 403 (16 U.S.C.
1421b) is amended—

(A) by amending the section heading to
read as follows:

“SEC. 403. STRANDING OR ENTANGLEMENT RE-
SPONSE AGREEMENTS.”; and

(B) in subsection (a) by inserting ‘‘or en-
tanglement’’ before the period.

(2) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of
contents at the end of the first section is
amended by striking the item relating to
section 403 and inserting the following:

‘“Sec. 403. Stranding or entanglement re-
sponse agreements’’.

(c) LIABILITY.—Section 406(a) (16 U.S.C.
1421e(a)) is amended by inserting ‘‘or entan-
glement’’ after ‘‘stranding”’.

(d) ENTANGLEMENT DEFINED.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 410 (16 U.S.C.
1421h) is amended—

(A) by redesignating paragraphs (1)
through (6) in order as paragraphs (2)
through (7); and

(B) by inserting before paragraph (2) (as so
redesignated) the following:

‘(1) The term ‘entanglement’ means an
event in the wild in which a living or dead
marine mammal has gear, rope, line, net, or
other material wrapped around or attached
to it and is—

‘““(A) on a beach or shore of the United
States; or

‘(B) in waters under the jurisdiction of the
United States.”.

2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
408(a)(2)(B)(1) (16 U.S.C. 1421f-1(a)(2)(B)(1)) is
amended by striking ‘‘section 410(6)’ and in-
serting ‘‘section 410(7)".

(e) JOHN H. PRESCOTT MARINE MAMMAL
RESCUE ASSISTANCE GRANT PROGRAM.—

(1) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR
GRANT PROGRAM.—Section 408(h) (16 U.S.C.
1421f-1(h)) is amended by striking ‘‘$5,000,000
for each of fiscal years 2001 through 2003’
and inserting ¢‘$5,000,000 for each of fiscal
years 2007 through 2010”°.

(2) ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS AND EXPENSES.—
Section 408 (16 U.S.C. 1421f-1) is amended—

(A) by adding at the end of subsection
(a)(1) the following: ‘““All funds available to
implement this section shall be distributed
to eligible stranding network participants
for the purposes set forth in this paragraph
and paragraph (2), except as provided in sub-
section (f).”’; and

(B) by amending subsection (f) to read as
follows:

“(f) ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS AND EX-
PENSES.—Of the amounts available each fis-
cal year to carry out this section, the Sec-
retary may expend not more than 5 percent
or $80,000, whichever is greater, to pay the
administrative costs and administrative ex-
penses to implement the grant program
under subsection (a). Any such funds re-
tained by the Secretary for a fiscal year for

AGREE-



July 17, 2006

such costs and expenses that are not used for
such costs and expenses before the end of the
fiscal year shall be provided as grants under
subsection (a).”.

(3) EMERGENCY ASSISTANCE.—Section 408 (16
U.S.C. 1421f-1) is amended—

(A) in subsection (a) by redesignating para-
graph (2) as paragraph (3), and by inserting
after paragraph (1) the following:

‘“(2) Subject to the availability of appro-
priations, the Secretary may also enter into
cooperative agreements, contracts, or such
other agreements or arrangements as the
Secretary considers appropriate to address
stranding events requiring emergency assist-
ance.”’;

(B) in subsection (d) by inserting ‘(1) be-
fore the text, and by adding at the end the
following:

‘(2) Funding for emergency stranding
projects shall not be subject to the funding
limit established in paragraph (1).”’;

(C) in subsection (e)—

(i) in paragraph (1) by striking ‘“The non-
Federal” and inserting ‘‘Except as provided
in paragraph (2), the non-Federal’’;

(ii) by redesignating paragraph (2) as para-
graph (3); and

(iii) by inserting after paragraph (1) the
following:

‘“(2) EMERGENCY ASSISTANCE.—NoO non-Fed-
eral contribution shall be required for fund-
ing for a response to an emergency stranding
event.”’; and

(D) in subsection (g) by redesignating para-
graph (2) as paragraph (3) and inserting after
paragraph (1) the following:

‘(2) EMERGENCY ASSISTANCE.—The term
‘emergency assistance’ means assistance
provided for a stranding event that—

‘“(A) is not an unusual mortality event as
defined in section 409(6);

‘(B) leads to an immediate increase in re-
quired costs for stranding response, recov-
ery, or rehabilitation in excess of regularly
scheduled costs;

‘(C) may be cyclical or endemic; and

‘(D) may involve out-of-habitat animals.”.

(4) CONTRIBUTIONS.—Section 408 (16 U.S.C.
1421f-1) is amended by adding at the end the
following:

‘(i) CONTRIBUTIONS.—For purposes of car-
rying out this section, the Secretary may so-
licit, accept, receive, hold, administer, and
use gifts, devises, and bequests.”.

(f) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR
MARINE MAMMAL UNUSUAL MORTALITY EVENT
FuND.—Section 409(3) (16 U.S.C. 1421g(3)) is
amended by striking ‘$500,000 for fiscal year
1993’ and inserting ‘‘$125,000 for each of fiscal
years 2007 through 2010°°.

SEC. 16. SCRIMSHAW EXEMPTION.

Any valid certificate of exemption referred
to in section 18 of Public Law 103-238 (16
U.S.C. 1539 note) that was valid under that
section on April 29, 1999, shall be valid during
the 11-year period beginning October 31, 1999.
SEC. 17. POLAR BEARS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Marine Mammal Pro-
tection Act of 1972 (16 U.S.C. 1361 et seq.) is
amended by adding at the end thereof the
following:

“TITLE V—POLAR BEARS
“SEC. 501. DEFINITIONS.

“In this title:

‘(1) AGREEMENT.—The term ‘Agreement’
means the Agreement Between the Govern-
ment of the United States of America and
the Government of the Russian Federation
on the Conservation and Management of the
Alaska-Chukotka Polar Bear Population,
signed at Washington, D.C., on October 16,
2000.

‘(2) ALASKA ©NANUUQ COMMISSION.—The
term ‘Alaska Nanuugq Commission’ means
the Alaska Native entity, in existence on the
date of enactment of this title, that rep-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

resents all villages in the State of Alaska
that engage in the annual subsistence taking
of polar bears from the Alaska-Chukotka
population and any successor entity.

‘“(3) IMPORT.—The term ‘import’ means to
land on, bring into, or introduce into, or at-
tempt to land on, bring into, or introduce
into, any place subject to the jurisdiction of
the United States, without regard to whether
the landing, bringing, or introduction con-
stitutes an importation within the meaning
of the customs laws of the United States.

‘“(4) POLAR BEAR PART OR PRODUCT.—The
term ‘part or product of a polar bear’ means
any polar bear part or product, including the
gall bile and gall bladder.

‘“(6) SECRETARY.—The term ‘Secretary’
means the Secretary of the Interior.

‘“(6) TAKING.—The term ‘taking’ has the
meaning given the term in the Agreement.

‘“(7) CoOMMISSION.—The term ‘Commission’
means the commission established under ar-
ticle 8 of the Agreement.

“SEC. 502. PROHIBITIONS.

‘‘(a) IN GENERAL.—It is unlawful for any
person who is subject to the jurisdiction of
the United States—

‘(1) to take any polar bear in violation of
the Agreement;

‘“(2) to take any polar bear in violation of
the Agreement or any annual taking limit or
other restriction on the taking of polar bears
that is adopted by the Commission pursuant
to the Agreement;

“(3) to import, export, possess, transport,
sell, receive, acquire, or purchase, exchange,
barter, or offer to sell, purchase, exchange,
or barter any polar bear, or any part or prod-
uct of a polar bear, that is taken in violation
of paragraph (2);

‘“(4) to import, export, sell, purchase, ex-
change, barter, or offer to sell, purchase, ex-
change, or barter, any polar bear gall bile or
polar bear gall bladder;

‘“(5) to commit, solicit another person to
commit, or cause to be committed, any of-
fense under this subsection; or

‘“(6) to violate any regulation promulgated
by the Secretary to implement any of the
prohibitions established in this subsection.

‘““(b) EXCEPTIONS.—For the purpose of fo-
rensic testing or any other law enforcement
purpose, the Secretary, and Federal law en-
forcement officials, and any State or local
law enforcement official authorized by the
Secretary, may import a polar bear or any
part or product of a polar bear.

“SEC. 503. ADMINISTRATION.

‘“(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, acting
through the Director of the United States
Fish and Wildlife Service, shall do all things
necessary and appropriate, including the pro-
mulgation of regulations, to implement, en-
force, and administer the provisions of the
Agreement on behalf of the United States.
The Secretary shall consult with the Sec-
retary of State and the Alaska Nanuuq Com-
mission on matters involving the implemen-
tation of the Agreement.

“(b) UTILIZATION OF OTHER GOVERNMENT
RESOURCES AND AUTHORITIES.—

‘(1) OTHER GOVERNMENT RESOURCES.—The
Secretary may utilize by agreement, with or
without reimbursement, the personnel, serv-
ices, and facilities of any other Federal agen-
cy, any State agency, or the Alaska Nanuuqg
Commission for purposes of carrying out this
title or the Agreement.

““(2) OTHER POWERS AND AUTHORITIES.—ANYy
person authorized by the Secretary under
this subsection to enforce this title or the
Agreement shall have the authorities that
are enumerated in section 6(b) of the Lacey
Act Amendments of 1981 (16 U.S.C. 3375(b)).

‘‘(c) ENSURING COMPLIANCE.—

“(1) TITLE I AUTHORITIES.—The Secretary
may use authorities granted under title I to
enforce this title.

H5229

‘(2) ADDITIONAL AUTHORITIES.—ANy gun,
trap, net, or other equipment used, to aid in
the violation or attempted violation of this
title shall be subject to seizure and forfeiture
under section 106.

“(d) REGULATIONS.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall pro-
mulgate such regulations as are necessary to
carry out this title and the Agreement.

¢“(2) ORDINANCES AND REGULATIONS.—If nec-
essary to carry out this title and the Agree-
ment, and to improve compliance with any
annual taking limit or other restriction on
taking adopted by the Commission and im-
plemented by the Secretary in accordance
with this title, the Secretary may promul-
gate regulations that adopt any ordinance or
regulation that restricts the taking of polar
bears for subsistence purposes if the ordi-
nance or regulation has been promulgated by
the Alaska Nanuuq Commission.

“SEC. 504. COOPERATIVE MANAGEMENT AGREE-
MENT; AUTHORITY TO DELEGATE
ENFORCEMENT AUTHORITY.

‘“‘(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, acting
through the Director of the United States
Fish and Wildlife Service, may share author-
ity under this title for the management of
the taking of polar bears for subsistence pur-
poses with the Alaska Nanuuq Commission if
such commission is eligible under subsection
().
‘“(b) DELEGATION.—To be eligible for the
management authority described in sub-
section (a), the Alaska Nanuuq Commission
shall—

‘(1) enter into a cooperative agreement
with the Secretary under section 119 for the
conservation of polar bears;

“(2) meaningfully monitor compliance
with this title and the Agreement by Alaska
Natives; and

“(3) administer its co-management pro-
gram for polar bears in accordance with—

‘“(A) this title; and

“(B) the Agreement.

“SEC. 505. COMMISSION APPOINTMENTS; COM-

PENSATION, TRAVEL EXPENSES,
AND CLAIMS.
‘“(a)  APPOINTMENT OF TU.S. CoMMIS-
SIONERS.—
‘(1) APPOINTMENT.—The TUnited States

commissioners on the Commission shall be
appointed by the President, in accordance
with paragraph 2 of article 8 of the Agree-
ment, after taking into consideration the
recommendations of—

‘“(A) the Secretary;

‘“(B) the Secretary of State; and

“(C) the Alaska Nanuuq Commission.

‘“(2) QUALIFICATIONS.—Both of the United
States commigssioners shall have knowledge
or expertise in polar bears.

‘“(3) SERVICE AND TERM.—Each TUnited
States commissioner shall serve—

““(A) at the pleasure of the President; and

‘(B) for an initial 4-year term and such ad-
ditional terms as the President shall deter-
mine.

*“(4) VACANCIES.—

‘““(A) IN GENERAL.—Any individual ap-
pointed to fill a vacancy occurring before the
expiration of any term of office of a United
States commissioner shall be appointed for
the remainder of that term.

‘(B) MANNER.—Any vacancy on the Com-
mission shall be filled in the same manner as
the original appointment.

““(b) ALTERNATE COMMISSIONERS.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, in con-
sultation with the Secretary of State and
the Alaska Nanuuq Commission, shall des-
ignate an alternate commissioner for each
member of the United States section.

‘“(2) DuTIES.—In the absence of a United
States commissioner, an alternate commis-
sioner may exercise all functions of the
United States commissioner at any meetings



H5230

of the Commission or of the United States

section.

‘“(3) REAPPOINTMENT.—An alternate com-
missioner—

‘“(A) shall be eligible for reappointment by
the President; and

‘(B) may attend all meetings of the United
States section.

‘(¢c) DUTIES.—The members of the United
States section may carry out the functions
and responsibilities described in article 8 of
the Agreement in accordance with this title
and the Agreement.

*‘(d) COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES.—

‘(1) COMPENSATION.—A member of the
United States section shall serve without
compensation.

‘(2) TRAVEL EXPENSES.—A member of the
United States section shall be allowed travel
expenses, including per diem in lieu of sub-
sistence, at rates authorized for an employee
of an agency under subchapter I of chapter 57
of title 5, United States Code, while away
from the home or regular place of business of
the member in the performance of the duties
of the United States-Russia Polar Bear Com-
mission.

‘“(e) AGENCY DESIGNATION.—The United
States section shall, for the purpose of title
28, United States Code, relating to claims
against the United States and tort claims
procedure, be considered to be a Federal
agency.

“SEC. 506. VOTES TAKEN BY THE UNITED STATES
SECTION ON MATTERS BEFORE THE
COMMISSION.

“In accordance with paragraph 3 of article
8 of the Agreement, the United States sec-
tion , made up of commissioners appointed
by the President, shall vote on any issue be-
fore the United States-Russia Polar Bear
Commission only if there is no disagreement
between the United States commissioners re-
garding the vote.

“SEC. 507. IMPLEMENTATION OF ACTIONS TAKEN
BY THE COMMISSION.

‘“(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall
take all necessary actions to implement the
decisions and determinations of the Commis-
sion under paragraph 7 of article 8 of the
Agreement.

““(b) TAKING LIMITATION.—Not later than 60
days after the date on which the Secretary
receives notice of the determination of the
Commission of an annual taking limit, or of
the adoption by the Commission of other re-
striction on the taking of polar bears for
subsistence purposes, the Secretary shall
publish a notice in the Federal Register an-
nouncing the determination or restriction.
“SEC. 508. APPLICATION WITH OTHER TITLES OF

ACT.

‘“The authority of the Secretary under this
title is in addition to, and shall not affect
the authority of the Secretary under, the
other titles of this Act or the Lacey Act
Amendments of 1981 (16 U.S.C. 3371 et seq.) or
the exemption for Alaskan natives under sec-
tion 101(b) of this Act.

“SEC. 509. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.
““There is authorized to be appropriated to

the Secretary to carry out this title and the

Agreement $2,000,000 for each of fiscal years

2007 through 2010.”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of
contents in the first section of the Marine
Mammal Protection Act of 1972 (16 U.S.C.
1361 et seq.) is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“TITLE V—POLAR BEARS
501. Definitions.

502. Prohibitions.

503. Administration.

504. Cooperative management agree-
ment; authority to delegate en-
forcement authority.

Commission appointments; com-
pensation, travel expenses, and
claims.

“Sec.
“Sec.
“Sec.
“Sec.

‘‘Sec. 505.

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

‘““Sec. 506. Votes taken by the United States
Section on matters before the
Commission.

507. Implementation of actions taken
by the Commission.

508. Application with other titles of
Act.

‘“Sec. 509. Authorization of appropriations.”’.

(c) TREATMENT OF CONTAINERS.—Section
107(d)(2) of the Marine Mammal Protection
Act of 1972 (16 U.S.C. 1377(d)(2)) is amended—

(1) by striking ‘‘or other conveyance’ and
inserting ‘‘, other conveyance, or container’’;
and

(2) by striking ‘‘or conveyance’’ and insert-
ing ‘‘conveyance, or container’’.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to the rule, the gentleman from Ar-
izona (Mr. RENZI) and the gentleman
from West Virginia (Mr. RAHALL) each
will control 20 minutes.

The Chair recognizes the gentleman
from Arizona.

GENERAL LEAVE

Mr. RENZI. Mr. Speaker, I ask unani-
mous consent that all Members may
have 5 legislative days to revise and ex-
tend their remarks and include extra-
neous material on the bill under con-
sideration.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is there
objection to the request of the gen-
tleman from Arizona?

There was no objection.

Mr. RENZI. Mr. Speaker, I yield my-
self such time as I may consume.

Mr. Speaker, I urge my colleagues to
support this legislation, which reau-
thorizes portions of the Marine Mam-
mal Protection Act, authored by Re-
sources Chairman RICHARD POMBO.

The Marine Mammal Protection Act
was enacted in 1972 with the purpose of
protecting and restoring marine mam-
mal populations. The act has been very
successful over its 30-year history in
recovering marine mammal popu-
lations, and this legislation builds on
those accomplishments.

Recently, there have been many news
reports on the status of polar bears and
other arctic marine mammal species.
H.R. 4075 includes language which will
allow for increased international co-
operation to help protect the shared
U.S.-Russia polar bear population. In
fact, without these provisions, the fu-
ture of polar bear populations in Rus-
sia is very much in jeopardy. It also
authorizes much needed research which
will afford us the opportunity to better
understand the needs of marine mam-
mals and give us the means to better
conserve these species for future gen-
erations.

H.R. 4075 also authorizes the Prescott
Marine Mammal Stranding program.
The Prescott program has been very
successful in recovering and rehabbing
thousands of stranded marine mam-
mals. The Prescott program supports a
network of facilities around the Nation
that have dedicated themselves to the
recovery of stranded marine mammals.

H.R. 4075 includes additional provi-
sions which will support the develop-
ment of cleaner fishing gear to reduce
interactions with marine mammals. It
also authorizes research to develop

“Sec.

“Sec.

July 17, 2006

nonlethal measures to control nuisance
pinniped populations. Finally, H.R. 4075
clarifies the permit requirements for
marine mammals on public display.

While it is not a major reauthoriza-
tion of the Marine Mammal Protection
Act, these amendments have been care-
fully crafted and are specifically de-
signed to enhance the fundamental
conservation goals of this important
law. This is a good conservation bill. It
is good for marine mammals, and it
should be overwhelmingly adopted.

Finally, I wish to thank Chairman
HENRY HYDE of the International Rela-
tions Committee and Chairman BILL
THOMAS of the Ways and Means Com-
mittee and their staffs for their co-
operation in moving this legislation.
At this time I will include in the
RECORD an exchange of letters between
our committees on this bill.

I urge an ‘‘aye’ vote on H.R. 4075.

COMMITTEE ON RESOURCES,
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES,
Washington, DC, July 13, 2006.
Hon. WILLIAM M. THOMAS,
Chairman, Committee on Ways and Means,
Washington, DC.

DEAR MR. CHAIRMAN: I ask your coopera-
tion to help schedule consideration by the
House of Representatives of H.R. 4075, the
Marine Mammal Protection Act Amend-
ments of 2006, during the week of July 17-21,
2006. I have proposed an amendment to this
bill which includes text from S. 2013, the
United States-Russia Polar Bear Conserva-
tion and Management Act of 2005. The Com-
mittee on Ways and Means has a jurisdic-
tional interest in this Senate bill because of
its inclusion of trade measures.

My staff has worked with yours to develop
a mutually-agreed on text for this amend-
ment, and I have enclosed this amendment
for your review. I ask that you not seek a re-
ferral of H.R. 4075 based on the inclusion of
this language to expedite Floor scheduling.
Of course, this action would not be consid-
ered as waiving or affecting your jurisdiction
over the subject matter of the amendment,
nor as precedent for any future referrals of
similar measures. Moreover, if the bill is
conference with the Senate, I would support
naming Ways and Means Committee mem-
bers to the conference committee for the
trade provisions. I would also be pleased to
include this letter and your response in the
Congressional Record during consideration
of the bill on the Floor.

Mr. Chairman, I have been very pleased
with the tremendous degree of cooperation
between our two Committees. Your staff, es-
pecially Angela Ellard and Steven Schrage,
has been responsive and thoughtful, and my
staff very much appreciates their support
and teamwork. I hope that you will give my
request serious consideration and I look for-
ward to your response.

Sincerely,
RICHARD POMBO,
Chairman.
COMMITTEE ON WAYS AND MEANS,
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES,
Washington, DC, July 13, 2006.
Hon. RICHARD W. POMBO,
Chairman, Committee on Resources,
Washington, DC.

DEAR CHAIRMAN PoMBO: Thank you for
your letter regarding H.R. 4075, the ‘‘Marine
Mammal Protection Act Amendments of
2006, which is scheduled for floor consider-
ation during the week of July 17th.

As you noted, the Committee on Ways and
Means maintains jurisdiction over trade



July 17, 2006

measures. H.R. 4075, as amended, includes
text which falls within the jurisdiction of
the Committee on Ways and Means. How-
ever, in order to expedite this bill for floor
consideration, the Committee will forgo ac-
tion. This is being done with the under-
standing that it does not in any way preju-
dice the Committee with respect to the ap-
pointment of conferees or its jurisdictional
prerogatives on this bill or similar legisla-
tion in the future.

I appreciate your cooperation in this mat-
ter and agree to your offer to include this ex-
change of letters in the Congressional
Record during floor consideration.

Best regards,
BILL THOMAS,
Chairman.
COMMITTEE ON RESOURCES,
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES,
Washington, DC, July 12, 2006.
Hon. HENRY J. HYDE,
Chairman Committee on International Rela-
tions, Washington, DC.

DEAR MR. CHAIRMAN: I ask your coopera-
tion to help schedule, consideration by the
House of Representatives of H.R. 4075, the
Marine Mammal Protection Act Amend-
ments of 2006, during the week of July 17-21,
2006. I have proposed an amendment to this
bill which includes text from S. 2013, the
United States-Russia Polar Bear Conserva-
tion and Management Act of 2005. Obviously,
the Committee on International Relations
has a jurisdictional interest in this Senate
bill.

My staff has worked with yours to develop
a mutually-agreed on text for this amend-
ment, and I have enclosed this amendment
for your review. I ask that you not seek a re-
ferral of H.R. 4075 based on the inclusion of
this language to expedite Floor scheduling.
Of course, this action would not be consid-
ered as waiving or affecting your jurisdiction
over the subject matter of the amendment,
nor as precedent for any future referrals of
similar measures. Moreover, if the bill is
conferenced with the Senate, I would support
naming International Relations Committee
members to the conference committee for
the polar bear provisions. I would also be
pleased to include this letter and your re-
sponse in the Congressional Record during
consideration of the bill on the Floor.

Mr. Chairman, I have been very pleased
with the tremendous degree of cooperation
between our two Committees. Your staff has
been responsive and thoughtful, and my staff
very much appreciates their support and
teamwork. I hope that you will give my re-
quest serious consideration, and I look for-
ward to your response.

Sincerely,
RICHARD POMBO,
Chairman.
Hon. RICHARD W. POMBO,
Chairman, Committee on Resources,
ington, DC.

DEAR MR. CHAIRMAN: Thank you for your
letter concerning H.R. 4075, the ‘‘Marine
Mammal Protection Act Amendments of
2006.” T understand that the text of your pro-
posed amendment contains text from S. 2013,
the “United States-Russia Polar Bear Con-
servation and Management Act of 2005.”"

The language in question does impact the
Rule X jurisdiction of the Committee on
International Relations. However, since our
committees have developed a mutually
agreed-upon text for this amendment, I will
agree not to seek a referral of H.R. 4075 in
order to expedite your Committee’s ability
to schedule this for House consideration.

I appreciate your willingness to support
the appointment of conferees from this Com-
mittee on this matter, should it go to con-

Wash-

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD —HOUSE

ference. Please place our exchange of letters
into the Record during the debate on this
matter.

With best wishes,

Sincerely,
HENRY J. HYDE,
Chairman.
Mr. Speaker, I reserve the balance of
my time.

Mr. RAHALL. Mr. Speaker, I yield
myself such time as I may consume.

(Mr. RAHALL asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

Mr. RAHALL. Mr. Speaker, in 1972
Congress enacted the Marine Mammal
Protection Act to protect marine mam-
mals from harmful human activities. It
is a landmark statute in our pantheon
of national environmental laws, pro-
viding for the conservation and man-
agement of whales, dolphins, porpoises,
seals, sea lions, and other marine mam-
mals.

In the past, consideration of amend-
ments to MMPA was done on a bipar-
tisan basis, such as significant changes
made by Congress in 1994. However,
during this Congress, I have stood op-
posed to further consideration of
MMPA legislation the Resources Com-
mittee approved almost 1 year to this
day, until today. Let me emphasize
that my opposition was until today.

This was because the bill would have
eliminated a fundamental mandate of
MMPA known as the ‘‘deadline for the
zero rate mortality goal.”” In other
words, we, as a Nation, are to strive to
put into place management regimes
which will reduce, and ideally elimi-
nate, marine mammal fatalities at the
hands of human beings.

The troublesome provision which
would have eliminated the deadline has
been dropped from the legislation we
are now considering. In this regard I
would like to express my appreciation
to Chairman PoOMBO for agreeing to
this, and I am pleased to say that I sup-
port the bill as amended today and
urge its approval by this body.

Mr. Speaker, I yield back the balance
of my time.

Mr. RENZI. Mr. Speaker, I yield back
the balance of my time.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The
question is on the motion offered by
the gentleman from Arizona (Mr.
RENzI) that the House suspend the
rules and pass the bill, H.R. 4075, as
amended.

The question was taken; and (two-
thirds having voted in favor thereof)
the rules were suspended and the bill,
as amended, was passed.

A motion to reconsider was laid on
the table.

———————

SPRINGFIELD ARMORY NATIONAL
HISTORIC SITE, MASSACHUSETTS
ACT OF 2006

Mr. RENZI. Mr. Speaker, I move to
suspend the rules and pass the bill
(H.R. 4376) to authorize the National
Park Service to enter into a coopera-
tive agreement with the Common-

H5231

wealth of Massachusetts on behalf of
Springfield Technical Community Col-
lege, and for other purposes, as amend-

d.
The Clerk read as follows:
H.R. 4376

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Rep-
resentatives of the United States of America in
Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Springfield
Armory National Historic Site, Massachu-
setts Act of 2006".

SEC. 2. FINDINGS.

Congress finds as follows:

(1) The Site commemorates the role of the
Springfield Armory in the Nation’s military
history, a role that the Armory served for al-
most 200 years.

(2) The role of the Springfield Armory
began in 1777, when the site was selected as
the location for a magazine and laboratory
for the development, production and storage
of guns and powder during the American
Revolution.

(3) Following the American Revolutionary
War, in 1794 Congress officially established
the Springfield Armory and for much of the
19th century the Springfield Armory devel-
oped and supplied most of the military small
arms manufactured by the United States for
the United States Armed Services.

(4) In addition to its historical role in the
development and manufacturing of small
arms, the Springfield Armory was also the
site of Shay’s Rebellion.

(5) In 1968 the Armory was deactivated as a
military installation and in 1974 Congress es-
tablished the Springfield Armory National
Historic Site. A portion of the Site is admin-
istered by the National Park Service. The re-
mainder of the Springfield Armory National
Historic Site, known as the ‘‘Preservation
Control Area”, is owned and administered by
the Commonwealth of Massachusetts on be-
half of Springfield Technical Community
College.

(6) The Preservation Control Area contains
several historic buildings that are in a state
of disrepair. The deteriorating condition of
these historic buildings threatens to under-
mine the character and integrity of the
Springfield Armory National Historic Site
and their repair, renovation, maintenance
and rehabilitation is essential to the contin-
ued preservation of the Site and its museum
and collections.

SEC. 3. PRESERVATION CONTROL AREA DEFINED.

For purposes of this Act, the term ‘‘Preser-
vation Control Area’” means that portion of
the Site that is owned by the Common-
wealth, as defined in the Memorandum of
Understanding Between the United States
and the Commonwealth of Massachusetts
dated August 21, 1999.

SEC. 4. COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT WITH RE-
SPECT TO THE PRESERVATION CON-
TROL AREA.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of the In-
terior, acting through the National Park
Service, may enter into a cooperative agree-
ment with the Commonwealth of Massachu-
setts on behalf of Springfield Technical Com-
munity College to provide financial assist-
ance to that college for the purpose of main-
taining, preserving, renovating, and rehabili-
tating any historic structures within the
Springfield Armory National Historic Site,
including historic structures located within
the Preservation Control Area.

(b) FIFTY PERCENT MATCH.—The Federal
share of the cost of activities carried out
using any assistance or grant under this Act
shall not exceed 50 percent.

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to the rule, the gentleman from Ar-
izona (Mr. RENZI) and the gentleman



		Superintendent of Documents
	2015-05-19T08:05:04-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




