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see him represent Morrison so well throughout 
the state. 

It is because of student leaders such as 
Keegan that I am especially proud to serve Illi-
nois’ 17th Congressional District. Madam 
Speaker, I would like to again formally con-
gratulate Keegan Anderson on his Class 1A 
State Finals title in Boys Track and Field. 

f 

HONORING BRIGADIER GENERAL 
DUSTIN A. SHULTZ 

HON. JENNIFFER GONZÁLEZ-COLÓN 
OF PUERTO RICO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Miss GONZÁLEZ-COLÓN of Puerto Rico. 
Madam Speaker, I am proud to recognize 
Brigadier General Dustin A. Shultz of the 1st 
Mission Support Command in the Caribbean 
Army Reserve. Brig. General Shultz arrived in 
my Congressional district of Puerto Rico days 
before Hurricane Irma hit the Island on Sep-
tember of 2017. Since then, she has served 
tirelessly over the last two years, where she 
consolidated 5,000 Army reserves soldiers 
from around the Caribbean to become a 
united front. She quickly adapted and inte-
grated herself seamlessly with the locals and 
led recovery efforts that were vital in our 
greatest moment of need. 

Since the beginning of her career in 1989, 
she has served as the Headquarters Company 
Commander of the 647th Area Support Group, 
as an Intelligence Analyst for JTF–N, and in 
2007 became the Executive Officer of the 
373rd MI Battalion under the 201st MI Brigade 
and just three years later, assumed command 
of the Battalion. She then served as a Joint 
Planner in the J9, supporting Haiti relief ef-
forts. Finally, in 2017, she was promoted to 
Brigadier General and was appointed to Puer-
to Rico. Under her exemplary leadership, the 
1st Mission Support Command was activated 
full time in Puerto Rico for the first time and 
has been carrying out relief efforts since. 

Throughout her career, Brig. General Shultz 
has been highly decorated with the Legion of 
Merit, the Bronze Star, the Joint Service Com-
mendation Medal, the Meritorious Service 
Medal, and the General Douglas MacArthur 
leadership award among many others. 

Her command in Puerto Rico ends this Au-
gust after 2 years of hard work and dedication. 
She will move on to become the Operations 
and Training Officer for the Army Reserve 
Command. As the sole representative from 
Puerto Rico, I thank her tremendously for all 
she has done and wish her much success in 
her next command. 

f 

RECOGNIZING WAUKEGAN TO 
COLLEGE 

HON. BRADLEY SCOTT SCHNEIDER 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Mr. SCHNEIDER. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to honor Melanie Antonio, Rafael 
Bonilla, Nyah Brown, Melissa Bueno, Armonie 
Collins, Cristian Diaz-Santos, Alejandro Gar-
cia, Marlenny Gonzalez, Syed Hussaini, 
Donville James, Lizbeth Jaquez-Mena, 

Michelle Martinez, Valeria Mencia, Gabriel 
Murray, Natalia Ocampo, Pedro Ocampo, 
Noemi Padilla, Alex Palomar, Aliyah Plummer, 
Lori Ruiz, and Kaitlyn Torres for their admit-
tance into the Waukegan to College (W2C) 
program. 

A year-round college readiness service, 
W2C launched in 2009 and seeks to advance 
local students’ intellectual and emotional de-
velopment, cultivating a strong commitment to 
community and a profound belief that they can 
build a brighter future for themselves, their 
families and their communities. By establishing 
high academic expectations and counseling 
students and their families on the college ap-
plication process, W2C helps students realize 
their full potential by making the dream of col-
lege a reality. 

All of these students will be the first in their 
families to attend college, and were selected 
for the W2C program due to both their impres-
sive academic achievements as well as their 
contributions to their communities. As leaders 
inside and outside the classroom, these stu-
dents show tremendous dedication and poten-
tial. 

Strengthening our communities requires re-
building the ladders of opportunity so that all 
Americans have the opportunity to succeed 
and thrive. This begins with providing each 
and every child, regardless of zip code, ac-
cess to a high quality, affordable education 
and continues by ensuring all families can af-
ford to send their sons and daughters to col-
lege. 

When our nation’s talented young people 
pursue their passions and follow their dreams, 
they accomplish far more than personal 
growth. They serve as role models in their 
communities and their achievements inspire 
and motivate other young people to equally 
strive and achieve. These students truly are 
Champions of Change. I wish them the very 
best of luck in their higher education and in all 
their future endeavors. 

f 

COMMEMORATING THE ONE HUN-
DREDTH ANNIVERSARY OF 
CUMMINS INC. 

HON. TOM REED 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Mr. REED. Madam Speaker, today I rise to 
commemorate the one hundredth anniversary 
of Cummins Inc. 

In 1919, Clessie Cummins and his business 
partner, William G. Irwin, joined together to 
form the Cummins Engine Company, devel-
oping diesel engines. From these humble be-
ginnings, the Cummins Engine Company has 
grown to become Cummins Inc., a leader 
among independent engine manufacturers 
producing a wide variety of engines and en-
gine system components. Today Cummins is 
listed as a Fortune 150 company, employing 
more than 62,000 people worldwide. 

While their headquarters may be located in 
Columbus, Indiana, Cummins Inc. has a long 
history with Jamestown, New York. In 1974, 
Cummins acquired a more than one million 
square foot facility in Jamestown to manufac-
ture engine components. Since the James-
town Engine Plant produced its first engine in 
1981 it has built more than two million en-

gines. The engines made in Jamestown serve 
customers around the world and the plant 
serves an important role in the company by 
serving a wide variety of markets. The James-
town Engine Plant is also dedicated to improv-
ing the community around them, annually con-
tributing one million dollars through charitable 
donations. It is a pleasure to recognize the 
success of Cummins and celebrate the con-
tributions that the Jamestown Engine Plant 
has made to our communities over the last 
forty-five years. 

One hundred years of successful business 
and forty-five years of serving the community 
is certainly a cause for celebration. I congratu-
late Cummins Inc. on this impressive mile-
stone and look forward to their continued suc-
cess in the years to come. 

Given the above, I ask that this Legislative 
Body pause in its deliberations and join me to 
commemorate the one hundredth anniversary 
of Cummins Inc. 

f 

CONGRATULATING NATHAN 
MICKLEY FOR HIS WIN AT THE 
STATE FINALS BOYS’ TRACK 
AND FIELD TOURNAMENT IN 
THE 4X800 METER RELAY 

HON. CHERI BUSTOS 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Mrs. BUSTOS. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to recognize Nathan Mickley, a junior from 
Morrison High School, who helped win the Illi-
nois High School Association’s Class 1A State 
Finals Boys’ Track and Field Tournament in 
the 4x800 Meter Relay. Nathan and his team 
finished first with a time of 7:57.85. 

Nathan and his teammates dominated their 
win at state. As a former athlete, I appreciate 
the fortitude Nathan displayed to achieve his 
dream of being a state champion and com-
mend him for his efforts and attitude. Nathan 
is an example of the importance of dedication 
and a strong work ethic. He is a wonderful ex-
ample of young and strong talent in our com-
munity. I am proud to see him represent Morri-
son so well throughout the state. 

It is because of student leaders such as Na-
than that I am especially proud to serve Illi-
nois’ 17th Congressional District. Madam 
Speaker, I would like to again formally con-
gratulate Nathan Mickley on his Class IA State 
Finals title in Boys Track and Field. 

f 

HONORING THE 75TH ANNIVER-
SARY OF TOASTMASTERS 
FOUNDER’S DISTRICT 

HON. J. LUIS CORREA 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Mr. CORREA. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to honor Toastmasters Founder’s District for 
their 75th anniversary of service and support 
to our local community. 

Ralph C. Smedley founded the Toast-
masters Founder’s District 75 years ago with 
the vision of establishing a first-choice center 
for developing dynamic, high-value, experien-
tial communication and leadership skills. Since 
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then, the Toastmasters has grown to over 140 
clubs throughout Orange County, California, 
and has more than 2,500 members. The 
Toastmasters Founder’s District assists other 
communities in building new clubs while sup-
porting existing clubs in achieving and main-
taining excellence. The Toastmasters Found-
er’s District continues to grow and now in-
cludes an international community under 
Toastmasters International. 

The Founder’s District and Toastmasters 
International aim to empower individuals to be-
come more effective communicators and lead-
ers. Members of Toastmasters, both past and 
present, have used their skills and experi-
ences from the organization and applied them 
to careers in politics, teaching, and more. 

Notably, one member placed in the top 
three at the World Championship Competition 
of Public Speaking, surpassing over 30,000 
competitors. Furthermore, the member was in-
vited to speak at a TEDx event as well as in 
various countries throughout Europe, the Mid-
dle East, and Asia. They believe that although 
there are many types of speeches, if you can 
master one, you can master them all. Toast-
masters provides the tools and valuable expe-
rience to practice and master skills such as 
speaking on a global platform. Through the 
experience, members are better equipped to 
achieve their goals. 

I ask my colleagues to join me in com-
mending the Toastmasters Founder’s District 
for its dedication to our local community and 
in honoring its 75 years of achievements and 
innovation in communication and leadership 
skills. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO CAROL S. LARSON 

HON. ANNA G. ESHOO 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Ms. ESHOO. Madam Speaker, I rise to 
honor and celebrate the career of Carol S. 
Larson, President and CEO of the David and 
Lucile Packard Foundation, who is retiring at 
the end of 2019 after 30 years with the Pack-
ard Foundation and 15 years serving as its 
President and CEO. Carol’s dedication to 
helping children and families in California, the 
United States, and around the world has im-
proved countless lives and made immeas-
urable contributions to the field of philan-
thropy. 

A graduate of Stanford University and Yale 
Law School, Carol joined the Packard Founda-
tion in 1989 and assumed the role of Director 
of Research and Grants, Law and Public Pol-
icy at the then-titled Center for the Future of 
Children where she focused her grantmaking 
on child health and welfare issues. She edited 
and contributed to the journal publication The 
Future of Children on topics ranging from 
drug-exposed infants, to school-linked serv-
ices, to home visiting, to juvenile courts, and 
taught two courses at Stanford Law School on 
child abuse and neglect. 

Carol became President and CEO of the 
Packard Foundation in 2004. Under her lead-
ership, the Foundation averaged $300 million 
in annual grantmaking and deployed $500 mil-
lion in total mission investments to hundreds 
of partners, ranging from community-based or-
ganizations around the world to renowned in-

stitutions in the Bay Area. During Carol’s ten-
ure, the Foundation also provided $349 million 
in funding to organizations and efforts working 
to improve the health and well-being of chil-
dren through the Packard Foundation’s Chil-
dren, Families, and Communities program. 
This funding has helped increase health care 
coverage for uninsured children; enrolled more 
children in preschool and introduced a new 
Transitional Kindergarten for four-year-olds; 
improved pediatric and obstetric care through 
the world-renowned Lucile Packard Children’s 
Hospital at Stanford University; strengthened 
the quality of early childhood programs; and 
ushered in a new understanding that the well- 
being of children must be viewed through the 
lens of the whole family. The Packard Founda-
tion’s integration of two-generation strategies 
that seek better outcomes for parents and chil-
dren together into its work promoting the well- 
being of children has shaped how philan-
thropy, policymakers, and advocates act on 
behalf of families. 

Under Carol’s tenure, the Packard Founda-
tion has also reinforced the Packard family’s 
strong commitment to Northern California. 
Since 2008, the Foundation has devoted over 
$156 million through its Local Grantmaking 
program to organizations committed to in-
creasing opportunities for families and commu-
nities in the Bay Area, raising the bar for other 
Silicon Valley philanthropists to support local 
organizations. 

In recognition of her work and her contribu-
tions to the field of philanthropy, Carol re-
ceived the Council on Foundation’s Distin-
guished Service Award in 2016; the American 
Leadership Forum—Silicon Valley’s 2019 John 
W. Gardner Award; and the World Affairs 
2019 Global Citizenship Award for her leader-
ship and dedication to the public good. 

Madam Speaker, I ask the entire House of 
Representatives to join me in congratulating 
Carol S. Larson on her extraordinary career 
and expressing our deepest appreciation to 
her for dedicating her life to improving the 
lives of children and families, and strength-
ening our county immeasurably. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF THE GOLD 
MEDAL CONGRESSIONAL AWARD 
ACHIEVED BY MR. TREVOR REY 

HON. EMANUEL CLEAVER 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Mr. CLEAVER. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to commemorate Mr. Trevor Rey’s ac-
complishment in receiving the Gold Medal 
Congressional Award, Congress’s highest 
honor for the youth of our country. In attaining 
this award, Mr. Rey demonstrated his commit-
ment to succeed in both his academic endeav-
ors and athletic events. Such an achievement 
could not have been done without the support 
and dedication of his family and community. I 
am honored and proud to represent the exem-
plary work of young people like Trevor Rey in 
Missouri’s Fifth Congressional District. 

The Congressional Gold Medal Award re-
quires much from those who seek to attain it, 
including a tenacity and drive that few pos-
sess. The Congressional Award was originally 
created in 1979 in an effort to recognize initia-
tive, service, and achievement in young peo-

ple. In order to receive such a prestigious 
award, applicants must complete a wide array 
of assignments, including at least 400 hours of 
voluntary public service, 200 hours of personal 
development and physical fitness, and a 5-day 
expedition. In order to complete his 400 hours 
of public service, Mr. Rey split his time among 
several community organizations. First, he 
served as a troop guide for his local Boy 
Scout Troop, Troop No. 46, on their trip to the 
Philmont Scout Camp, where they worked to 
earn merit badges and learn how to be good 
scouts. Mr. Rey also volunteered at his 
church, the Red Bridge United Methodist 
Church, and at his high school, Center High 
School in Kansas City. In addition, Mr. Rey 
serves in the United States Naval Sea Cadet 
Corps where he developed an appreciation for 
our country’s rich naval history and helped 
senior citizens affected by Hurricane Harvey in 
Houston, Texas by cleaning debris and paint-
ing houses. Mr. Rey also set physical goals in 
order to become a better wrestler for his high 
school. In order to fulfill this goal, Mr. Rey at-
tended a wrestling camp to learn advanced 
wrestling skills and improve his endurance and 
strength. Through his commitment, Mr. Rey 
demonstrated what it means to work for the 
betterment of your community and achieve 
personal growth in the process. Mr. Rey and 
his fellow recipients continue the great legacy 
of those receiving the Congressional Award. 

Madam Speaker, please join me and all of 
Missouri’s Fifth Congressional District in con-
gratulating Mr. Trevor Rey for receiving the 
Gold Medal Congressional Award. I encourage 
my fellow citizens to follow the example of Mr. 
Rey and the rest of the Congressional Award 
recipients and commit ourselves not only to 
personal improvement, but to the improvement 
of our communities as well. 

f 

CONGRATULATING HUNTER NEW-
MAN FOR HIS WIN AT THE 
STATE FINALS BOYS’ TRACK 
AND FIELD TOURNAMENT IN 
THE 4X800 METER RELAY 

HON. CHERI BUSTOS 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, August 20, 2019 

Mrs. BUSTOS. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to recognize Hunter Newman, a freshman 
from Morrison High School, who won the Illi-
nois High School Association’s Class 1A State 
Finals Boys’ Track and Field Tournament in 
the 4x800 Meter Relay. Hunter and his team 
finished first with a time of 7:57.85. 

Hunter and his teammates easily overcame 
the second-place team for their win at state. 
As a former athlete, I appreciate the fortitude 
Hunter displayed to achieve his dream of 
being a state champion and commend him for 
his efforts and attitude. Hunter is an example 
of the importance of dedication and a strong 
work ethic. I am proud to see him represent 
Morrison so well throughout the state with his 
talent and passion. 

It is because of student leaders such as 
Hunter that I am especially proud to serve Illi-
nois’ 17th Congressional District. Madam 
Speaker, I would like to again formally con-
gratulate Hunter Newman on his Class 1A 
State Finals title in Boys’ Track and Field. 
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