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HONORING WILL STATOM 

HON. LUKE MESSER 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. MESSER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today, on 
behalf of the entire 6th Congressional District 
of Indiana, to recognize Will Statom for his 
contribution to our state and country. 

Will is a true patriot and someone I could al-
ways rely on for on-the-ground political advice. 
Until his retirement, Will worked tirelessly to 
advance Republican values and to improve 
the quality of life for Hoosiers living in Dela-
ware County Our state is better off today be-
cause of his extraordinary leadership and 
service. 

On a personal note, Will was among my 
earliest and most vocal supporters. I would 
like to thank him for his loyal friendship and 
support of my work in Congress. I wish him 
continued success in all that God has planned 
for him in his retirement. 

f 

TERRORISM REMAINS A DEADLY 
CHALLENGE WE MUST CONFRONT 

HON. TED POE 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. POE of Texas. Mr. Speaker, the threat 
of terrorism remains a deadly challenge for us 
and our allies around the globe. In the last 
four years alone, we have seen the ability of 
terrorist groups—many of which we had 
thought we had defeated—to evolve and at-
tract thousands of recruits to their violent 
cause. ISIS, al-Qaeda, Iran, and all their affili-
ates and proxies are still active and waiting in 
the shadows for an opportunity to strike again. 

Although we have made great progress 
against these terrorists on the battlefields of 
Iraq, Syria, Libya, and Afghanistan, our gains 
remain fragile. Just last week, a report by the 
Pentagon warned that ISIS fighters have 
moved underground and are regrouping. We 
must not become complacent again. We must 
continue to be vigilant until the ideologies that 
motivate violent extremism are cast into the 
dustbin of history. 

I applaud the White House’s new National 
Strategy for Counterterrorism. This document 
drastically changed the U.S. government’s 
perspective on the war on terrorism. It cor-
rectly frames the battle in terms of an endur-
ing challenge that must be managed to protect 
the homeland, instead of a mission that has a 
beginning and end. It clearly recognizes the 
broad and diverse challenges we face from 
terrorism, including Iran’s growing network of 
terrorist proxies and the ability of terrorists to 
exploit cyberspace. 

The strategy prioritizes countering terrorist 
use of the Internet for radicalization, recruit-
ment, and fundraising. This is a priority I intro-
duced into the State Authorities bill last Con-
gress and I am glad the White House is taking 
it seriously. The strategy also makes clear that 
this fight is not America’s burden alone. Our 
international partners play an important role. 
We can empower them by bolstering their ca-
pabilities and increasing cooperation. 

That is where the State Department’s 
Counterterrorism Bureau comes in. Created in 

1972 in response to the Munich Olympics at-
tack, the Bureau forges partnerships with for-
eign governments, multilateral organizations, 
and NGOs to coordinate and advance U.S. 
counterterrorism objectives that enhance glob-
al security as well as our own. 

Under that broad mission it has several core 
responsibilities, including coordinating strategy 
across the State Department and other agen-
cies, conducting counterterrorism diplomacy, 
and building capacity of partner nations to ad-
dress terrorist threats within their own. 

Given the enduring threat from terrorism 
that we and our allies face, it is crucial that CT 
Bureau does its job effectively and efficiently. 
It is our job in Congress to ensure that the 
American taxpayers are getting their money’s 
worth. When we are talking about millions of 
dollars going towards programs abroad, the 
people of my district are right to demand how 
it contributes to their safety and security. This 
is all the more important given that the Bureau 
has seen significant funding cuts over recent 
years. With limited resources every penny 
must be spent wisely. 

For example, the State Department’s In-
spector General filed a report last year that 
found much of the antiterrorism assistance we 
had been given to Pakistan was not being 
used, including dozens of courses not imple-
mented. I am pleased to hear the Bureau has 
since repurposed many of the resources that 
had been sent to Pakistan to other more 
worthwhile programs. We cannot afford to 
throw good money after bad. Effective moni-
toring and evaluation programs are crucial to 
spotting what is not working and making 
changes that do. 

For instance, we need assurances that the 
programming initiated and implemented by CT 
Bureau to prevent radicalization actually 
works. Is the Bureau still in the business of 
‘‘countering violent extremism’’ (CVE)? If so, 
has the Bureau developed any mechanisms to 
prove that such programming works? 

I appreciated the strong comments against 
Iranian-backed terrorism by the State Depart-
ment’s Coordinator for Counterterrorism, Am-
bassador Nathan Sales, which were at the 
Washington Institute on November 13. I am 
eager to see our government go one step fur-
ther than just designating the IRGC for ter-
rorist activity. If we mean business, we must 
go after the Iran’s terrorist proxies in Iraq and 
Syria. 

I applaud Treasury’s designations of four 
Hezbollah-affiliated terrorists in Iraq. Now the 
State Department must follow suit and finally 
designate groups like Asa’ib Ahl al-Haq and 
Harakat Hezbollah al-Nujaba for what they 
are: foreign terrorist organizations. At the very 
least, their affiliation with the IRGC should be 
enough to meet the criteria for designation. 

And that’s just the way it is. 
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HONORING STATE SENATOR JEFF 
RAATZ 

HON. LUKE MESSER 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. MESSER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today, on 
behalf of the entire 6th Congressional District 
of Indiana, to recognize State Senator Jeff 
Raatz for his contribution to our state. 

Jeff represents Randolph, Wayne, Union, 
Dearborn, Franklin and Fayette counties in the 
Indiana State Senate. He continues to be a 
strong advocate on a wide variety of important 
issues, including education, workforce, and the 
state’s budget. It was a pleasure to work with 
him and our state is better off today because 
of his extraordinary leadership and service. 

On a personal note, Jeff is a loyal friend, 
wise adviser, and friend in faith. I want to 
thank Jeff for his friendship and support of my 
work in Congress. I wish him continued suc-
cess in all that God has planned for him and 
his family. 

f 

RECOGNIZING COL. CHARLIE 
JONES ON HIS RETIREMENT 

HON. BRADLEY BYRNE 
OF ALABAMA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. BYRNE. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
recognition of a true public servant, Colonel 
Charles ‘‘Charlie’’ Jones, on his retirement as 
Chief Deputy of the Baldwin County Sheriff’s 
Office (BCSO). Throughout his career, Col. 
Jones displayed a deep devotion to Baldwin 
County and exceptional leadership. He has 
had an immeasurable impact on the lives of 
countless members of our community. 

Col. Jones began his career in uniform in 
1980 as a volunteer for the Fairhope Police 
Department. This attitude of selfless service 
has been the theme of his entire career as a 
first responder in Southwest Alabama. In 
1981, Col. Jones became a patrol officer with 
the Fairhope Police, and then in 1983 he 
transitioned to the Baldwin County Sheriff’s 
Office. 

In the Baldwin County Sheriff’s Office, Col. 
Jones proved himself as an outstanding officer 
in the Narcotics Division, quickly working his 
way up the ranks to be a Lieutenant in the 
Narcotics Division by 1991. Just seven years 
later, he was promoted once again to Captain 
in the Patrol Division, as well as the com-
mander of the ERT (SWAT) teams. Since 
2007, Col. Jones has served as the Chief 
Deputy, a testament to his leadership and in-
credible ability as a law enforcement officer. 

Col. Jones has worked under three sheriffs 
of Baldwin County throughout his career and 
has received several awards and acknowl-
edgements throughout his tenure with the 
BCSO. He was awarded Best Participant and 
the Officer Survival Training Award at the 
South West Alabama Police Academy; Officer 
of the Year by the Perdido Bay Optimist Club; 
and recognized twice by U.S. Customs Serv-
ice for Outstanding Contributions to their oper-
ations. Perhaps chief among his accomplish-
ments is that he organized the most progres-
sive and longest serving Multi-Jurisdictional 
Narcotics Task Force in Southwest Alabama. 

He also serves on the Gulf Coast High In-
tensity Drug Trafficking Area Initiative Board of 
Directors, the 911 Board, is a member of the 
National Sheriffs Association and the Alabama 
Narcotics Association, and previously served 
on the Board of Directors for the Spanish Fort 
Fire Rescue. 

As he enters the next chapter of his life, I 
wish Charlie, his wife Debbie, children and 
grandchildren all the best as they get to enjoy 
more time with each other. I know that in this 
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new chapter, Col. Jones will continue to serve 
the public in every way he can through his 
tireless efforts to make our community a safer, 
stronger, and overall better place to be. 

Mr. Speaker, please join me in recognizing 
the incredible service of Col. Charlie Jones as 
he leaves a legacy of 38 years to a grateful 
community. It is difficult to express our grati-
tude in mere words, but on behalf of Ala-
bama’s First Congressional District and the 
United States House of Representatives, we 
simply say: thank you. 
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HONORING STATE 
REPRESENTATIVE RANDY FRYE 

HON. LUKE MESSER 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. MESSER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today, on 
behalf of the entire 6th Congressional District 
of Indiana, to recognize State Representative 
Randy Frye for his contribution to our state. 

Since 2010, Randy has represented Dear-
born, Decatur, Jefferson, Jennings, Ripley, 
Ohio and Switzerland counties with honor and 
integrity in the Indiana General Assembly. He 
continues to be a strong advocate for Hoosier 
veterans at the Statehouse, and without a 

doubt Indiana is better off today because of 
his extraordinary leadership and service. 

On a personal note, I want to thank Randy 
for his friendship and support of my work in 
Congress. I wish him continued success in all 
that God has planned for his family. 
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HONORING STATE 
REPRESENTATIVE TOM SAUNDERS 

HON. LUKE MESSER 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. MESSER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today, on 
behalf of the entire 6th Congressional District 
of Indiana, to recognize State Representative 
Tom Saunders for his contribution to our state. 

For 22 years, Tom has represented East 
Central Indiana with honor and integrity in the 
Indiana General Assembly. He has always put 
the interests of his district first and continues 
to be a strong advocate for improving our 
schools, rebuilding Indiana’s infrastructure and 
giving a voice to our local governments. It was 
an honor to serve with him during my time in 
the Indiana General Assembly. 

On a personal note, Tom has been a loyal 
friend and wise adviser during my entire ten-
ure in Congress. I thank him for his friendship 

and support of my work and wish Tom and his 
wife, Sue, continued success in all that God 
has planned for their family. 

f 

HONORING STATE 
REPRESENTATIVE DICK HAMM 

HON. LUKE MESSER 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2018 

Mr. MESSER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today, on 
behalf of the entire 6th Congressional District 
of Indiana, to recognize State Representative 
Dick Hamm for his contribution to our state. 

Dick represents Wayne County with honor 
and integrity in the Indiana General Assembly. 
Through his work at the Boys and Girls Club 
and other local organizations, Dick has made 
a positive impact in his community. He con-
tinues to be a strong advocate for Hoosier 
families at the Statehouse, and Indiana is bet-
ter off today because of Dick’s extraordinary 
leadership and service. 

On a personal note, I want to thank Dick for 
his friendship and support of my work in Con-
gress. I wish him continued success in all that 
God has planned for his family. 
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