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for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. SCHNEIDER. Mr. Speaker, 
across the country, communities are 
struggling with an epidemic of opioid 
addiction, abuse, and overdose; and 
across party lines, we all agree some-
thing must be done to address this cri-
sis. 

But the repeal-and-replace plan pro-
posed by my Republican colleagues 
adds fuel to the fire. The bill elimi-
nates the Affordable Care Act’s re-
quirement that Medicaid cover basic 
mental health and addiction services. 

Economists estimate 1.3 million 
Americans receive treatment for sub-
stance abuse and other mental health 
disorders through the Medicaid exten-
sion. 

Across the States that have expanded 
Medicaid, like Illinois, the program is 
used for 27 percent of all addiction 
treatment. 

We are not going to arrest our way 
out of this epidemic; instead, we need 
to treat addiction like the disease that 
it is. Removing the mental health cov-
erage requirement pulls the rug out 
from more than a quarter of all those 
seeking help from opioid addiction. 

Mr. Speaker, opioids now kill more 
Americans than car accidents. The Af-
fordable Care Act offers hope and is 
saving lives. The Republican efforts to 
repeal the ACA is a bleak step back-
wards. I strongly urge my colleagues to 
vote against this legislation. 

f 

ADVOCATING FOR PATIENT- 
CENTERED HEALTH CARE 

(Mr. ABRAHAM asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. ABRAHAM. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today as a practicing physician who be-
lieves that we must repeal the disaster 
that ObamaCare has brought us and re-
turn to a patient-centered system. 

My patients have dealt with sky-
rocketing premiums, unaffordable 
deductibles, and a formulary so restric-
tive it is an insult to call it a real 
treatment. 

Medicaid expansion is no better and 
gives only the illusion of sound cov-
erage. These patients can’t find doc-
tors. They can’t find specialists who 
will see them, which results in more 
hospital admissions, more unnecessary 
hospital referrals, more expensive trips 
to the emergency room, and higher 
costs to the program and to the tax-
payers. 

There is nothing compassionate 
about cramming more people into a 
failed system just so politicians can 
score political points. All they have 
done is force a second-class insurance 
onto first-class people. 

All Americans deserve better than 
ObamaCare. We can provide a better 
healthcare delivery system for them 
where everyone has access to afford-
able care, and it starts with the pas-
sage of the American Health Care Act. 

LOSING HEALTHCARE COVERAGE 
UNDER THE AMERICAN HEALTH 
CARE ACT 
(Ms. BASS asked and was given per-

mission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Ms. BASS. Mr. Speaker, since Janu-
ary I have received hundreds of mes-
sages from constituents who are pan-
icked that they will lose healthcare 
coverage with the Republican plan, 
where people will pay more for less. 

Although the talking points of the 
Republican plan references access to 
health care, care will only be acces-
sible for people with enough money to 
pay. 

A message I received from Vera 
Caldas: 

My husband has leukemia, and if it wasn’t 
for the ACA, he would be dead by now. I am 
living in fear that if he loses ObamaCare, 
that will mean his death sentence since he 
won’t be able to afford insurance to continue 
his treatment. 

A message from Lee Portillo: 
The ACA allowed my wife to start her Sil-

icon Valley beach business in Venice, Cali-
fornia and still have access to health care. 
The ACA is pro small entrepreneur and gives 
us the freedom to work on our own and still 
have insurance. 

My constituents, like millions across 
the Nation, are afraid they might be 
one of the 14 million people who will 
lose coverage if the Republican plan is 
passed. 

f 

b 1215 

TRUMPCARE IS A TERRIBLE BILL 
(Mr. GENE GREEN of Texas asked 

and was given permission to address 
the House for 1 minute and to revise 
and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. GENE GREEN of Texas. Mr. 
Speaker, this week Republicans plan to 
vote on TrumpCare to push 24 million 
Americans off healthcare coverage and 
saddle families across the country with 
massive health costs. TrumpCare is an 
assault on families and a broken prom-
ise to the American people. 

Twenty-four million people will lose 
their health insurance. It will termi-
nate the assistance that people depend 
on to afford quality coverage. It will 
destroy the Medicaid program, the bed-
rock of our social safety net for more 
than 50 years. 

Medicaid covers 74 million children, 
pregnant women, people with disabil-
ities, and seniors with long-term care 
needs. Under TrumpCare, deductibles 
and out-of-pocket costs will skyrocket 
and families will be exposed to crush-
ing health costs. Premiums will rise 
dramatically—particularly, for older 
Americans—because TrumpCare allows 
insurance companies to charge five 
times higher than what others pay for 
the average, five times higher for our 
near senior citizens. This means thou-
sands and thousands of dollars more in 
premiums, which low-income seniors 
cannot afford. 

TrumpCare shortens the life of the 
Medicare trust fund by 3 years and cuts 
$880 billion from Medicaid. 

Mr. Speaker, this is a terrible bill, 
and it puts the entire healthcare sys-
tem at risk. 

f 

DO NOT REPLACE THE AFFORD-
ABLE CARE ACT WITH 
TRUMPCARE 

(Ms. FRANKEL of Florida asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute and to revise and 
extend her remarks.) 

Ms. FRANKEL of Florida. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise to talk about the Republican’s 
sick plan to repeal the Affordable Care 
Act and replace it with TrumpCare, 
where the wealthy will get huge tax 
cuts and the rest of America will pay 
more for less. Twenty-four million will 
be losing their doctors, their nurses, 
and their medicine, and my constitu-
ents are frightened. 

Just ask Amy Bernard, whose mom, 
Francine, like 70 percent of Americans 
living in nursing homes, pays for it 
with Medicaid. Francine was a teacher. 
She planned for her retirement. She 
had savings, Social Security, and a 
pension. Then she was diagnosed with 
Parkinson’s disease, and she spent all 
her savings on in-home care. And then 
one day after a near-fatal fall, her fam-
ily realized she needed around-the- 
clock care. 

TrumpCare means tax cuts for the 
very rich, less for the rest of Ameri-
cans, gutting Medicaid, and sending 
folks like Francine to the curb. 

f 

DO NOT REPEAL THE 
AFFORDABLE CARE ACT 

(Mr. CORREA asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. CORREA. Mr. Speaker, on Thurs-
day we will vote on the future of health 
care for America. We need to do what 
is right for our district and for our con-
stituents. We need to protect the Af-
fordable Care Act. 

The ACA works, but like America’s 
other great healthcare program, Medi-
care, it needs a little time to get there. 
Today, Medicare covers over 55 million 
Americans and is a staple for our sen-
iors; but back in 1965, people had a very 
negative opinion of Medicare. Today, 52 
years later, Medicare is one of the most 
efficient healthcare systems in our 
country. 

I urge my colleagues: Do not repeal 
the Affordable Care Act. If you do, 24 
million Americans will lose their cov-
erage and older Americans will pay 
higher premiums. I ask my colleagues 
to keep the ACA. Let’s do the right 
thing. 

f 

BIG PHARMA IS A BIG WINNER IN 
TRUMPCARE 

(Mr. DOGGETT asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. DOGGETT. Mr. Speaker, Thurs-
day these Republicans are awarding a 
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new grand prize, a big-dollar award. 
Unfortunately, the contest has been 
rigged so that your name is not in the 
winner’s circle. Instead, the world lead-
ers in prescription price gouging, high-
est drug prices to Americans than just 
about anywhere, are declared the win-
ners of the grand prize in the Trump 
Republican sweepstakes that they call 
repealing ObamaCare. 

With Big Pharma’s exceptional, dis-
tinguished service in charging astro-
nomical prices and blocking competi-
tion to their government-approved mo-
nopolies, these Republicans have in-
cluded a no-strings-attached $25 billion 
tax windfall for Big Pharma in their 
so-called ObamaCare repeal. 

Now, with their latest late-night 
amendment, the prize is already grow-
ing bigger and bigger by the moment. 
And all of those American families 
that are out there struggling, trying to 
access lifesaving drugs, they don’t win 
a dime in this contest. 

Mr. Speaker, let’s reject this phony 
Republican giveaway where only Big 
Pharma is the big winner. 

f 

HONORING THE LEGENDARY 
CHUCK BERRY 

(Mr. CLAY asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. CLAY. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
honor a legendary American musical 
genius, an inaugural member of the 
Rock and Roll Hall of Fame, and a 
former neighbor and friend of the Clay 
family for six decades, the father of 
rock and roll, the immortal Chuck 
Berry, who died this past Saturday at 
the age of 90. 

I grew up just a few blocks away 
from the Berry residence. My sisters 
and I came up with his kids, and our 
families knew each other very well. 
Chuck Berry was one of the first Black 
superstars whose innovative music was 
not only popular with African-Amer-
ican audiences, but with young music 
fans around the world. 

Since his death, tributes from across 
every spectrum of music have poured 
in, including The Rolling Stones, U2, 
Sir Paul McCartney, Stevie Wonder, 
Bruce Springsteen, and hundreds of 
other internationally known artists 
who were deeply influenced by Chuck 
Berry’s magical music. 

On behalf of my family, I want to ex-
press our deepest condolences to the 
Berry family; and on behalf of music 
fans everywhere, I want to give thanks 
for the life of this legendary American 
treasure whose legacy and unique 
sound will live on for generations, a 
true St. Louis original, the real king of 
rock and roll: Chuck Berry. 

f 

TRUMPCARE IS A TOTAL 
DISASTER FOR AMERICA 

(Mr. SOTO asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. SOTO. Mr. Speaker, 
TrumpCare—a total disaster for Amer-
ica. Here it is by the numbers, per our 
own nonpartisan Congressional Budget 
Office: 24 million Americans will lose 
coverage, with 14 million Americans 
losing coverage in year one; 15 to 20 
percent increases in health insurance 
premiums in year one; and if you are 
paying $1,700, you will be paying $14,600 
in premium increases if you are a 64- 
year-old making $26,500 per year. 

But where does the money go? $592 
billion in tax cuts for the rich. That is 
where it is going. 

The conclusions: TrumpCare robs 
health care from American working 
families to give tax cuts to the rich. 

So vote ‘‘no’’ on TrumpCare to vote 
‘‘yes’’ on health care for America’s 
working families. 

f 

EMBRACE THE GOAL OF HEALTH 
CARE FOR ALL OUR CITIZENS 

(Mr. WELCH asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. WELCH. Mr. Speaker, this coun-
try, since Harry Truman, has had an il-
lusive but desirable goal, and that is 
health care for all of our citizens. We 
made two strides: one in 1964, with the 
passage of Medicare; another in 2010, 
with the passage of ObamaCare. 

We should be moving towards Medi-
care for all our citizens. Instead, this 
bill does not move forward. It goes 
back. 

Number one, 24 million Americans 
will lose their health care. 

Number two, Americans who have 
been living a life of toil and effort all 
of their lives from the ages of 50 to 64— 
at a time when they need health care 
the most—are in danger of losing it 
with the excessive tax that is being im-
posed on them by this bill. 

Number three, our community hos-
pitals, from the prairies of Nebraska to 
the hills of Vermont, those are critical 
institutions providing care. They have 
gone from red ink to black ink as a re-
sult of the Affordable Care Act. Every 
single one of those is in jeopardy, and 
that is going to deprive our citizens in 
those communities of access to afford-
able health care. 

This bill must be defeated. Let’s em-
brace the goal of health care for all our 
citizens. 

f 

REPUBLICANS SHOULD JOIN 
DEMOCRATS IN REJECTING 
TRUMPCARE 

(Mr. KILDEE asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. KILDEE. Mr. Speaker, thousands 
of my constituents have contacted me 
very concerned about the Republican 
healthcare bill—TrumpCare—which 
would mean higher costs and worse 
care for hardworking families. 

On the campaign trail, then-can-
didate Trump promised that ‘‘everyone 

would be covered’’ under his plan. We 
now know that is a broken promise, 
that under TrumpCare 24 million 
Americans will lose their health insur-
ance—24 million people. 

What kind of promise is that? 
Then-candidate Trump promised that 

there would be no cuts to Medicaid, but 
he will cut $880 billion from Medicaid. 

What kind of promise is that? A bro-
ken promise. 

Seniors overwhelmingly voted for 
President Trump, but he has already 
forgotten them, imposing an age tax on 
them. If you are 50 to 64, fasten your 
seatbelts. You are going to pay five 
times what a younger, healthier person 
would pay for worse coverage. 

This is a terrible bill. Democrats and 
Republicans should reject it. 

f 

TRUMPCARE MISSES THE MARK 
(Mr. POLIS asked and was given per-

mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. POLIS. Mr. Speaker, there is 
kind of a rather ridiculous healthcare 
bill that this body may or may not be 
considering soon. 

First of all, it creates an entirely 
new entitlement program at the State 
level rather than the Federal level. 

Second of all, in an unrelated matter, 
it provides huge tax cuts to million-
aires and billionaires—mostly in New 
York and California—which has noth-
ing to do with making health care af-
fordable. I mean, it is fine. Republicans 
want to do that. We get that. They al-
ways want to cut taxes for million-
aires, but don’t put it in the same bill 
as we are here trying to provide health 
care for people and bring down our in-
surance rates. 

Third of all, this bill that is supposed 
to somehow help is going to increase 
insurance costs to American families 
by 15 to 20 percent. Most families can’t 
afford that, and 24 million people will 
lose their insurance. 

So there is just no way, shape, or 
form that this bill makes any sense. 

There are a lot of positive improve-
ments and suggestions that we can 
make to the Affordable Care Act. There 
are a lot of great ideas with us pro-
viding a public option, more pricing 
transparency, a lot of great ideas that 
probably Democrats and Republicans 
support; but, frankly, they missed the 
mark on this bill. 

These aren’t ideas that Democrats or 
Republicans support, because they are 
bad ideas that cost families money. 

f 

PROVIDING FOR CONSIDERATION 
OF H.R. 372, COMPETITIVE 
HEALTH INSURANCE REFORM 
ACT OF 2017 
Mr. COLLINS of Georgia. Mr. Speak-

er, by direction of the Committee on 
Rules, I call up House Resolution 209 
and ask for its immediate consider-
ation. 

The Clerk read the resolution, as fol-
lows: 
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