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IN RECOGNITION OF THE 

ROHRERSVILLE BAND HALL’S 
100TH YEAR ANNIVERSARY 

HON. JOHN K. DELANEY 
OF MARYLAND 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. DELANEY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
congratulate the community of Rohrersville 
and join with them in celebration of the 
Rohrersville Band Hall’s 100th Year Anniver-
sary. The Rohrersville Band Hall was built by 
the community band and first opened its doors 
in 1916. The Rohrersville Band Hall has 
served as a rehearsal space, Town Hall, and 
concert venue to the people of Rohrersville for 
the last 100 years. 

The Rohrersville community’s commitment 
to preserving and maintaining this historic 
building is nothing short of inspiring. It is so 
critical to preserve and celebrate local history. 
So much has changed since 1916, but this 
building and the band who calls it home have 
stood the test of time. 

f 

CELEBRATING TAIWAN’S TEN TEN 

HON. MATT SALMON 
OF ARIZONA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. SALMON. Mr. Speaker, on October 10, 
2016, Taiwan celebrates the National Day of 
the Republic of China, more commonly known 
as double-ten day. I wish all Taiwanese a safe 
and happy National Day, and hope for many 
more to come. I lived in Taiwan for two years 
while serving a church mission, and quickly 
grew to love the people of Taiwan, their way 
of life, democratic values, and open-market 
principles. Taiwan has left a lasting impression 
on me and I have celebrated and worked to 
protect the U.S.-Taiwan relationship ever 
since. 

In Congress, I’ve striven to ensure that Tai-
wan’s close friendship and faithfulness as a 
global citizen is never forgotten. Just this year, 
Taiwan reminded the world once again that a 
vibrant democracy can thrive in the region with 
the peaceful election of a new leader through 
genuinely free and fair elections. I congratu-
late President Tsai once again and wish her 
well in leading her people. 

Congress has also acted to include Taiwan 
in the international community and prevent 
marginalization efforts by China. As the world 
grows smaller and more interconnected, it is 
not only unreasonable that Taiwan is not at 
the table, it is dangerous. For that reason, I 
want to express my profound disappointment 
that the United Nations failed to include Tai-
wan in the International Civil Aviation Organi-
zation Assembly this year. As we all know, 
Taiwan airports are among the busiest in the 
world, and pressure from China should not 
lead to putting passenger safety at risk. I urge 
the UN to include Taiwan as a participant in 
all future ICAO assemblies; in addition to all 
other international organizations as they would 
be a valuable addition to addressing our many 
global challenges. 

Congress and the United States stand firm 
in our commitment to Taiwan, and will con-
tinue to do so. I look forward to celebrating 

another double-ten day along with my friends 
in Taiwan this year and in the years to come. 

f 

RECOGNIZING DYSAUTONOMIA 
AWARENESS MONTH 

HON. BRIAN HIGGINS 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. HIGGINS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize the millions that fight each day 
against Dysautonomia, a group of debilitating 
medical conditions that result in a malfunction 
of the autonomic nervous system. This system 
is responsible for ‘‘automatic’’ bodily functions 
such as respiration, heart rate, blood pressure, 
digestion, and temperature control, things that 
many of us have the luxury of taking for grant-
ed. Dysautonomia continues to significantly 
impact the lives of Americans across the 
United States especially in Western New York. 

As is, dysautonomia can be extremely de-
bilitating but an often unseen symptom of this 
disability is the social isolation that accom-
panies it. The stress on the families of those 
impacted coupled with the financial hardships 
warrant our recognition as well as awareness. 
I am proud to affirm that the outstanding char-
acter and strong moral fiber of those in the 
Western New York community has provided 
the much needed support for the victims suf-
fering from dysautonomia. Looking ahead, it 
will be crucial for the community to rally 
around these victims as they continue their 
hard fought battle against this disease. 

Dysautonomia awareness is monumental in 
the early detection of the disease due to the 
fact that most patients take years to be prop-
erly diagnosed. Dysautonomia International, a 
non-profit organization that advocates on be-
half of patients living with dysautonomia, en-
courages communities to deepen their under-
standing and be mindful of this challenging 
condition especially during Dysautonomia 
Awareness Month each October. The tireless 
efforts of the Dysautonomia community for in-
creased research and accessible services will 
be recognized on Saturday, October 1 in my 
Congressional District as the color turquoise 
will bathe Niagara Falls and the Peace Bridge 
in the light of care, concern and continuing the 
fight to improve the lives of individuals living 
with this chronic condition. 

Currently, Dysautonomia International is 
funding research to develop more substantial 
treatments and hopefully find a cure for all 
forms of this condition in the future. 

I wanted to recognize the contributions of 
the professional medical community, patients 
and family members who are working to edu-
cate our citizenry about dysautonomia 
throughout Western New York. They are de-
serving of our support, recognition and re-
spect. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask that my colleagues join 
me in support for those suffering from the dev-
astating medical condition and encourage 
them to spread awareness across our nation 
throughout and beyond the month of October. 

THE OCCASION OF TAIWAN’S 
NATIONAL DAY 

HON. DAVID SCHWEIKERT 
OF ARIZONA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. SCHWEIKERT. Mr. Speaker, Beijing’s 
concentrated effort to isolate Taiwan from the 
global community, coupled with Taiwan’s am-
biguous sovereignty status has contributed to 
its exclusion from many international organiza-
tions and agreements. This is despite Tai-
wan’s willingness and capability to be a major 
actor on the international stage. 

This past year, the world witnessed Tai-
wan’s third peaceful transition to power as the 
first woman was elected in Taiwan. The 23 
million people on the island of Formosa rep-
resent the only democracy in the Chinese 
speaking world. While Taiwan might be sepa-
rated by oceans and different cultures, we are 
united in our respect for democracy and 
human rights. 

As an economic partner and vital ally, the 
United States should aid Taiwan in ensuring 
its meaningful participation in international or-
ganizations and bodies that it has expressed 
interest in participating. It is of vital importance 
for Taiwan’s inclusion in the International Civil 
Aviation Organization. Taiwan occupies a crit-
ical geographical location and handles large 
cargo and passenger volumes. More than 47 
foreign airlines operate flights from Taipei to 
over 100 international destinations. For the 
sake of passenger safety and international se-
curity, it is crucial Taiwan be brought into the 
ICAO fold. Any exclusion from the Inter-
national Civil Aviation Organization is unnec-
essary and unconstructive. 

On this noteworthy day Congress and the 
United States are provided the opportunity to 
evaluate our relationship with Taiwan. As 
such, the United States should work with Tai-
wan and our allies to ensure Taiwan is fully in-
cluded in the international community, includ-
ing the ICAO. 

f 

IN HONOR OF SHEN-YI MICHELLE 
CHANG 

HON. PAUL A. GOSAR 
OF ARIZONA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. GOSAR. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize and bring attention to an out-
standing individual who has come to the 
United States and demonstrated that the 
American Dream is still alive and waiting for 
those who are willing to strive for it and are 
committed to achieving it. 

Shen-Yi Michelle Chang, now residing in 
Phoenix, Arizona, has shown the grit and re-
solve that has so long been a staple of Amer-
ican pioneers across this country. She found-
ed her own real estate firm and has excelled 
at real estate development and sales. In so 
doing, she has helped countless others 
achieve their dream of home ownership, a cor-
nerstone of the American Dream. Her dynamic 
office is a mainstay of the community and em-
ploys Arizonans from diverse backgrounds. 

Her peers have recognized her hard work 
and talent. Soon, Ms. Chang will be installed 
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as the 2017 President of the Arizona State 
Women’s Council of Realtors (WCR) and she 
will be the first Asian American to take office 
in its 78 year history. A woman dedicated to 
public service and the well-being of others, 
Ms. Chang serves on multiple commissions for 
the City of Chandler, Arizona. She has found-
ed and runs numerous non-profits and even 
works in support of the local Little League 
team. 

It is an honor to recognize her hard work, 
diligence and determination. I congratulate Ms. 
Chang on behalf of the members of Congress 
and thank her for showing all of us what self- 
reliance and motivation can achieve and how 
such success can benefit one’s community. 

f 

IN CELEBRATION OF TAIWAN’S 
NATIONAL DAY 

HON. MICHAEL C. BURGESS 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. BURGESS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Taiwan’s National Day, celebrated on 
October 10th, and to offer my best wishes to 
the people of Taiwan. 

Also known as Double Ten Day, since it 
takes place on the 10th day of the 10th 
month, this holiday marks a special time for 
the Taiwanese as they celebrate their rich cul-
ture and take part in festivities across the 
country of Taiwan as well as here in the 
United States where Taiwanese-Americans 
have enhanced and diversified the culture of 
many cities and towns. 

The state of Texas has a strong bond with 
the Taiwanese, bolstered by the trade of agri-
cultural goods and products. I am also proud 
to have joined several of my colleagues from 
Texas to cosponsor legislation geared towards 
fostering Taiwanese prosperity as well as sup-
porting their admission to the United Nations. 

The 26th Congressional District of Texas 
has experienced great diversification and en-
richment thanks to the people of Taiwan. I am 
glad to call them friends of Texas and friends 
of the 26th district. 

I wish the people of Taiwan all the best as 
they celebrate Double Ten Day. 

f 

HONORING LT. COL. IRA STEPHEN 
‘‘SHOOTER’’ EADIE 

HON. JOHN GARAMENDI 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. GARAMENDI. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
in honor of Lieutenant Colonel Ira Stephen 
‘‘Shooter’’ Eadie, who died on September 20, 
2016 while flying a routine training mission. 

At 9:05 am, the TU–2S piloted by Lt Col 
Eadie and his trainee crashed near the Sutter 
Buttes in California. They were assigned to 
the 1st Reconnaissance Squadron at Beale 
Air Force Base. Although both pilots ejected 
from the aircraft, Lt Col Eadie did not survive. 

Lt Col Eadie was a respected pilot who 
began his military career in the Navy, flying P– 
3 patrol aircraft. He eventually joined the Air 
Force and became a U–2 pilot. The U–2 is a 
notoriously difficult aircraft to fly—becoming a 

U–2 pilot means you are among the very best. 
He was part of an elite, tight-knit group of pi-
lots, whose flights more closely mirror those of 
astronauts—the U–2 flies at altitudes over 
70,000 feet, at the very edge of the atmos-
phere, affording the pilot breathtaking views of 
the horizon, watching nighttime creep across 
the Earth. 

Steve was a loving and devoted family man. 
He met his wife Ashley in Lake City, FL, and 
together they raised six children, and recently 
welcomed a granddaughter. 

Mr. Speaker, pilots fondly quote, ‘‘Oh! I 
have slipped the surly bonds of earth, and 
danced the skies on laughter-silvered wings’’. 
Today, it is my heartfelt honor to remember a 
cherished member of the flying community, Lt 
Col ‘‘Shooter’’ Eadie, who has put out his 
hand, and touched the face of God. In the 
days to come, may strength and comfort be 
granted to his family and friends, the 1st Re-
connaissance Squadron and Beale Air Force 
Base, and the entire Dragon Lady community. 

f 

THANKING PATRICIA ORSINI FOR 
HER DEDICATED SERVICE TO 
THE HOUSE 

HON. CANDICE S. MILLER 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mrs. MILLER of Michigan. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to acknowledge and thank Ms. Pa-
tricia Orsini who is retiring on September 30, 
2016, as the Director of the Wounded Warrior 
Program at the United States House of Rep-
resentatives. 

Patricia joined the House of Representatives 
in February 2008 after a long and distin-
guished career in the Marine Corps. For the 
past eight and a half years, Patricia has 
served as the first, and only, Director of the 
House Wounded Warrior Program. To embark 
on this endeavor, Patricia relied on the skills 
and instinct honed as a Marine and quickly 
rose to the challenge of creating a brand new 
program for our Nation’s Wounded Warriors. 

Through Patricia’s guidance, assistance, 
and expert placement, many Members of Con-
gress have come to rely on the Fellows as tal-
ented advisors and reliable advocates for mili-
tary and veterans affairs issues. Every day, 
the Fellows are asked to attend and lead 
meetings with constituents, conduct policy 
analysis on complex issues, handle important 
and sensitive casework with the utmost care 
and compassion, and serve as a liaison with 
the Departments of Defense and Veterans Af-
fairs. 

However, one only needs to look at the re-
sults of the program to understand and appre-
ciate that the true benefit rests with the Vet-
erans and their families. Over the course of 
the program’s eight year history, Patricia 
helped place 142 Wounded Warriors into fel-
lowships in Washington, DC and District Of-
fices nationwide. Of those, 23 Fellows 
transitioned to full-time employment with the 
Member office. An additional 53 accepted a 
full-time position outside of the House of Rep-
resentatives. Fifteen other Fellows advanced 
their career path by accepting a job with the 
Department of Veterans Affairs. All in all, 75 
percent of the Wounded Warrior fellows either 
accepted a full-time position or returned to col-

lege after completing their assignment with the 
Member office. 

Mr. Speaker, I would also like to commend 
and thank Patricia for her military service. Pa-
tricia began her career in the Marines in 1975 
as the Assistant Editor at the Marine Corps In-
stitute in Washington, DC. Over the next 33 
years, she rose to become a Master Gunnery 
Sergeant, which is the highest rank an en-
listed Marine can achieve. Patricia retired from 
the Marine Corps in 2008 as the Program 
Manager for the Wounded Warrior Regiment 
in Quantico, Virginia. 

Clearly Patricia’s background in the Marine 
Corps made her the right candidate to serve 
as the first and, up to this point, only Director 
of the House of Representatives Wounded 
Warrior Program. 

On behalf of the entire House community, 
we extend congratulations to Patricia Orsini for 
her many years of dedication, outstanding 
contributions, and service to the United States 
House of Representatives and to our grateful 
Nation. 

We wish Patricia many great years in ful-
filling her retirement dreams. 

f 

RECOGNITION OF THE 15TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF HEALTHLINK DEN-
TAL CLINIC IN SOUTHAMPTON 

HON. MICHAEL G. FITZPATRICK 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, HealthLink 
Dental Clinic opened its doors in 2001 in 
Southampton, Bucks County Pennsylvania as 
a medical and dental clinic providing free care 
to underserved adults. The 15th anniversary, 
this year, marks the opening of a free dental 
clinic. The change from a medical-dental facil-
ity to a dental clinic resulted from the in-
creased availability to healthcare through ex-
pansion of the eligibility requirements for Med-
icaid coverage and the Affordable Care Act. 
But little progress has been made regarding 
access to dental care; therefore, in March 
2015, HealthLink Dental Clinic, Inc. became a 
sole provider of dental care with an expansion 
of the clinic and collaboration with Temple 
University’s Kornberg School of Dentistry. 
Congratulations on this milestone and for rec-
ognizing a need in Bucks and Montgomery 
counties, and stepping in. In so doing, 
HealthLink has set an example of profes-
sionalism and charitable giving for others to 
follow. 

f 

CONGRATULATING ST. JOHN 
MACOMB-OAKLAND HOSPITAL 

HON. SANDER M. LEVIN 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, September 28, 2016 

Mr. LEVIN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to con-
gratulate St. John Macomb-Oakland Hospital 
in Warren as it celebrates its 50th anniversary 
this year. 

In 1955, the greater Warren Chamber of 
Commerce and others recognized a need for 
quality health care and so began the effort to 
build a hospital in the south end of Macomb 
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