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fellow Idahoans by suggesting I create 
two awards: the Spirit of Idaho for vol-
unteers, and the Spirit of Freedom for 
veterans and those who work with vet-
erans. These awards recognize the ex-
traordinary efforts of Idahoans and the 
service of veterans and volunteers serv-
ing veterans. She also helped achieve 
hard-sought land access and conserva-
tion policies. Linda was a nurse by 
training and profession, which is con-
sistent with her gift for helping and 
caring for people, a behavior she dem-
onstrated repeatedly. The legacy that 
she left upon her retirement remains 
today in the Crapo office. 

Since news of her unexpected passing 
has reached my staff and former staff 
members, remembrances of Linda have 
poured in. I would like to share a few 
with you: 

‘‘Linda was a singular individual who 
set the pace for constituent services in 
Idaho. She cared for individuals and 
families, not ‘cases’. Her approach in-
fluenced me and how I set up suc-
ceeding constituent services oper-
ations. Her zealous care for people has 
been emulated and has resulted in 
thousands of Idahoans getting the help 
they deserve from their government.’’ 

‘‘Linda was truly an amazing, gen-
erous, and gracious lady. She truly was 
beautiful both inside and out. Linda 
made me feel so welcome on my first 
trip to Idaho. She joked with people 
that she introduced me to that I was 
from way, way Southern Idaho. We de-
cided that Lava Hot Springs would be 
my adopted hometown. Really being 
from Louisiana, I loved that Linda and 
I shared strong Southern roots, and 
great wacky stories.’’ 

‘‘She has that southern mixture of 
sweetness and sass with an underlying 
spirit and determination that was al-
ways apparent.’’ 

Beyond her professional accomplish-
ments, Linda was a great friend. Not 
only did she pay attention to my pro-
fessional needs, but she also recognized 
when some personal time was needed. 
Many times when I was working in her 
region, she built in time in the sched-
ule for a much needed clothes shopping 
trip, a visit to the eye doctor, or just 
some down time with my family. My 
wife, family, and I have all been 
blessed with her friendship. Linda will 
be missed beyond measure, and I ex-
tend deep condolences to family and 
friends. Thank you for your service, 
Linda. Rest in peace, dear friend. 
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RECOGNIZING CANDLE-LITE COM-
PANY ON ITS 175TH ANNIVER-
SARY 

Mr. PORTMAN. Mr. President, today 
I wish to honor Candle-lite Company— 
the oldest continually operating candle 
company in the United States—as it 
celebrates its 175th anniversary. 

Candle-lite Company was founded in 
1840 by Thomas Emery, who traveled 
door-to-door selling candles in Cin-
cinnati, OH. His venture continued to 
grow and eventually his son, Thomas 

Jr, joined the business. Candle-lite’s 
products were manufactured in various 
locations in the Cincinnati area before 
manufacturing was moved to its cur-
rent location in Leesburg, OH, in 1952. 

Today, Candle-lite’s 1 million-square- 
foot manufacturing and distribution fa-
cility in Leesburg employs over 600 
Ohioans annually and the corporate 
headquarters in Blue Ash employs 70. 

I congratulate Candle-lite and its 
employees in making its first 175 years 
a success and extend my best wishes 
for the next 175 years. 
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ADDITIONAL STATEMENTS 

TRIBUTE TO RUTH GRIFFIN 

∑ Ms. AYOTTE. Mr. President, today I 
wish to honor one of New Hampshire’s 
most revered and accomplished leaders, 
Ruth Lewin Griffin, as she celebrates 
her 90th birthday. 

Born in Fall River, MA, Ruth moved 
to Portsmouth, NH, at a young age and 
continues to reside there today. Most 
notably, she served as executive coun-
cilor for the third district of New 
Hampshire for 20 years. As a testament 
to her continued commitment to the 
Granite State, Ruth currently serves 
as chairman of the Portsmouth Hous-
ing Authority. 

But Ruth’s career of service began 
long before her time on the executive 
council. After graduating from Ports-
mouth High School, Ruth went on to 
pursue a degree from Wentworth Hos-
pital School of Nursing. Using the 
skills she learned as a registered nurse, 
she dove headfirst into a career as a 
public servant, holding office as a 
State senator and State representative 
and serving on the Portsmouth Police 
Commission and board of education. 
She also served as a delegate to two 
Constitutional Conventions and as a 
Republican national committeewoman. 
Ruth has earned well-deserved praise 
for her service to our State, including 
being named one of New Hampshire’s 
Ten Most Powerful Women for 6 years 
in a row, and most recently, she re-
ceived the 2015 Granite State Legacy 
Award, which honors dedication to the 
State, its people, and way of life. 

In addition to her tremendous service 
to New Hampshire, Ruth has been 
blessed with a wonderful family, in-
cluding the late John Griffin, five chil-
dren, five grandchildren, and two 
great-grandsons. Four generations of 
the Griffin family have lived on their 
family farm, raising sheep, chickens, 
and other livestock. As the matriarch 
of the family, Ruth strives to teach her 
family members the values she learned 
on the farm—hard work, humility, and 
perseverance. She will often tell you, 
invoking her family motto, that she 
lives her life ‘‘by courage, not by cun-
ning.’’ 

Ruth embodies the spirit of a true 
New Hampshire leader. Her life is 
marked by her dedicated service and 
her devotion to making New Hamp-

shire a better place to live and work. I 
had the privilege of serving alongside 
Ruth in the Governor’s office and the 
attorney general’s office and will be 
forever grateful for her wisdom, guid-
ance, and mentorship. I am very proud 
to recognize and celebrate Ruth’s 
birthday and her extraordinary con-
tributions to the State. I wish Ruth 
and her family the best on this very 
special day and for many more years of 
health and happiness.∑ 
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REMEMBERING LAURA MYERS 
∑ Mr. HELLER. Mr. President, today, 
we honor the life and legacy of Laura 
Myers, whose passing signifies a great 
loss to Nevada. I send my condolences 
and prayers to her family and friends 
during this time of hardship. Laura 
was an incredible person, committed to 
bringing joy to those around her 
through humanitarian service and fair- 
and-balanced news to residents across 
Nevada. She truly represented the best 
of journalistic excellence. She will be 
sorely missed by the entire Nevada 
family. 

Laura was born on August 26, 1961, in 
Las Vegas. She spent the majority of 
her childhood in northern Nevada, 
where she received her education and 
graduated from the University of Ne-
vada, Reno. She began her journalism 
career with the Reno Gazette-Journal 
in 1984 and took her first step in polit-
ical coverage, reporting the Nevada 
Legislature, in 1987. She was then hired 
in 1988 by the Associated Press to cover 
news in Carson City and later in the 
San Francisco and San Jose, CA, areas. 

Over the next 20 years, Laura pursued 
both her humanitarian and journalistic 
passion, leaving and returning to the 
AP several times and working with 
Habitat for Humanity in Uganda, Mon-
golia, and New York, alongside her day 
job throughout the 1990s and 2000s. 
Laura’s first departure from the AP 
was in 1992 after she joined the Peace 
Corps, where she spent time working to 
help a remote village in Togo, West Af-
rica. In 1995, Laura worked with the 
American Refugee Committee, man-
aging logistics at a refugee camp in the 
Congo. Immediately after, she accepted 
another job offer from the AP with a 
position covering politics, foreign af-
fairs, the military, and national secu-
rity in Washington, DC. 

In 2003, Laura left the AP and ful-
filled her passion for movies, studying 
at the New York Film Academy. After-
wards, in 2006, Laura spent 10 months 
in North Africa and the Middle East as 
a management consultant for Arabic- 
and French-language newspapers. After 
filling another position with the AP in 
2007, Laura worked for Food for All of 
Washington. From 1988 to 2008, her ex-
traordinary hard work and good char-
acter maintained a good relationship 
with the AP, continuously preserving 
an opportunity to return. In 2009, after 
committing time to teaching English 
to adults in Egypt, Laura returned to 
Nevada and was hired as the Las Vegas 
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