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September 20, 2005: 

H.R. 804. An Act to exclude from consider-
ation as income certain payments under the 
national flood insurance program. 

H.R. 3669. An Act to temporarily increase 
the borrowing authority of the Federal 
Emergency Management Agency for car-
rying out the national flood insurance pro-
gram. 

September 21, 2005: 
H.R. 3169. An Act to provide the Secretary 

of Education with waiver authority for stu-
dents who are eligible for Pell Grants who 
are adversely affected by a natural disaster. 

H.R. 3668. An Act to provide the Secretary 
of Education with waiver authority for stu-
dents who are eligible for Federal student 
grant assistance who are adversely affected 
by a major disaster. 

H.R. 3672. An Act to provide assistance to 
families affected by Hurricane Katrina, 
through the program of block grants to 
States for temporary assistance for needy 
families. 

September 23, 2005: 
H.R. 3761. An Act to provide special rules 

for disaster relief employment under the 
Workforce Investment Act of 1998 for individ-
uals displaced by Hurricane Katrina. 

H.R. 3768. An Act to provide emergency tax 
relief for persons affected by Hurricane 
Katrina. 

September 29, 2005: 
H.R. 3649. An Act to ensure funding for 

sportfishing and boating safety programs 
funded out of the Highway Trust Fund 
through the end of fiscal year 2005, and for 
other purposes. 

September 30, 2005: 
H.R. 2132. An Act to extend the waiver au-

thority of the Secretary of Education with 
respect to student financial assistance dur-
ing a war or other military operation or na-
tional emergency. 

H.R. 2385. An Act to extend by 10 years the 
authority of the Secretary of Commerce to 
conduct the quarterly financial report pro-
gram. 

H.R. 3200. An Act to amend title 38, United 
States Code, to enhance the 
Servicemembers’ Group Life Insurance pro-
gram, and for other purposes. 

H.R. 3784. An Act to temporarily extend 
the programs under the Higher Education 
Act of 1965, and for other purposes. 

H.R. 3864. An Act to provide vocational re-
habilitation services to individuals with dis-
abilities affected by Hurricane Katrina or 
Hurricane Rita. 

H.J. Res. 68. A joint resolution making 
continuing appropriations for the fiscal year 
2006, and for other purposes. 

October 4, 2005: 
H.R. 3667. An Act to designate the facility 

of the United States Postal Service located 
at 200 South Barrington Street in Los Ange-
les, California, as the ‘‘Karl Malden Sta-
tion’’. 

H.R. 3767. An Act to designate the facility 
of the United States Postal Service located 
at 2600 Oak Street in St. Charles, illinois, as 
the ‘‘Jacob L. Frazier Post Office Building’’. 

October 7, 2005: 
H.R. 3863. An Act to provide the Secretary 

of Education with waiver authority for the 
reallocation rules in the Campus-Based Aid 
programs, and to extend the deadline by 
which funds have to be reallocated to insti-
tutions of higher education due to a natural 
disaster. 

October 18, 2005: 
H.R. 2360. An Act making appropriations 

for the Department of Homeland Security for 
the fiscal year ending September 30, 2006, and 
for other purposes. 

October 20, 2005: 
H.R. 3971. An Act to provide assistance to 

individuals and States affected by Hurricane 
Katrina. 

November 8, 2005: 
H.R. 1409. An Act to amend the Foreign As-

sistance Act of 1961 to provide assistance for 
orphans and other vulnerable children in de-
veloping countries, and for other purposes. 

November 10, 2005: 
H.R. 2744. An Act making appropriations 

for Agriculture, Rural Development, Food 
and Drug Administration, and Related Agen-
cies for the fiscal year ending September 30, 
2006, and for other purposes. 

November 11, 2005: 
H.R. 2967. An Act to designate the Federal 

building located at 333 Mt. Elliott Street in 
Detroit, Michigan, as the ‘‘Rosa Parks Fed-
eral Building’’. 

H.R. 3765. An Act to extend through March 
31, 2006, the authority of the Secretary of the 
Army to accept and expend funds contrib-
uted by non-Federal public entities and to 
expedite the processing of permits. 

November 14, 2005: 
H.R. 3057. An Act making appropriations 

for foreign operations, export financing, and 
related programs for the fiscal year ending 
September 30, 2006, and for other purposes. 

November 19, 2005: 
H.R. 2419. An Act making appropriations 

for energy and water development for the fis-
cal year ending September 30, 2006, and for 
other purposes. 

H.R. 4326. An Act to authorize the Sec-
retary of the Navy to enter into a contract 
for the nuclear refueling and complex over-
haul of the U.S.S. Carl Vinson (CVN–70). 

H.J. Res. 72. A joint resolution making fur-
ther continuing appropriations for the fiscal 
year 2006, and for other purposes. 

November 21, 2005: 
H.R. 4133. An Act to temporarily increase 

the borrowing authority of the Federal 
Emergency Management Agency for car-
rying out the national flood insurance pro-
gram. 

November 22, 2005: 
H.R. 2490. An Act to designate the facility 

of the United States Postal Service located 
at 442 West Hamilton Street, Allentown, 
Pennsylvania, as the ‘‘Mayor Joseph S. 
Daddona Memorial Post Office’’. 

H.R. 2862. An Act making appropriations 
for the Departments of State, Justice, and 
Commerce, and related agencies for the fis-
cal year ending September 30, 2006, and for 
other purposes. 

H.R. 3339. An Act to designate the facility 
of the United States Postal Service located 
at 2061 South Park Avenue in Buffalo, New 
York, as the ‘‘James T. Malloy Post Office 
Building’’. 

November 30, 2005: 
H.R. 2528. An Act making appropriations 

for military quality of life functions of the 
Department of Defense, military construc-
tion, the Department of Veterans Affairs, 
and related agencies for the fiscal year end-
ing September 30, 2006, and for other pur-
poses. 

H.R. 3058. An Act making appropriations 
for the Departments of Transportation, 
Treasury, and Housing and Urban Develop-
ment, the Judiciary, District of Columbia, 
and independent agencies for the fiscal year 
ending September 30, 2006, and for other pur-
poses. 

December 1, 2005: 
H.R. 126. An Act to amend Public Law 89– 

366 to allow for an adjustment in the number 
of free roaming horses permitted in Cape 
Lookout National Seashore. 

H.R. 539. An Act to designate certain Na-
tional Forest System land in the Common-
wealth of Puerto Rico as components of the 
National Wilderness Preservation System. 

H.R. 606. An Act to authorize appropria-
tions to the Secretary of the Interior for the 
restoration of the Angel Island Immigration 
Station in the State of California. 

H.R. 1972. An Act to direct the Secretary of 
the Interior to conduct a special resource 
study to determine the suitability and feasi-
bility of including in the National Park Sys-
tem certain sites in Williamson County, Ten-
nessee, relating to the Battle of Franklin. 

H.R. 1973. An Act to make access to safe 
water and sanitation for developing coun-
tries a specific policy objective of the United 
States foreign assistance programs, and for 
other purposes. 

H.R. 2062. An Act to designate the facility 
of the United States Postal Service located 
at 57 West Street in Newville, Pennsylvania, 
as the ‘‘Randall D. Shughart Post Office 
Building’’ . 

H.R. 2183. An Act to designate the facility 
of the United States Postal Service located 
at 567 Thompkins Avenue in Staten Island, 
New York, as the ‘‘Vincent Palladino Post 
Office’’ . 

H.R. 3853. An Act to designate the facility 
of the United States Postal Service located 
at 208 South Main Street in Parkdale, Ar-
kansas, as the Willie Vaughn Post Office. 

H.R. 4145. An Act to direct the Joint Com-
mittee on the Library to obtain a statue of 
Rosa Parks and to place the statue in the 
United States Capitol in National Statuary 
Hall, and for other purposes. 

December 7, 2005: 
H.R. 584. An Act to authorize the Secretary 

of the Interior to recruit volunteers to assist 
with, or facilitate, the activities of various 
agencies and offices of the Department of the 
Interior. 

H.R. 680. An Act to direct the Secretary of 
the Interior to convey certain land held in 
trust for the Paiute Indian Tribe of Utah to 
the City of Richfield, Utah, and for other 
purposes. 

H.R. 1101. An Act to revoke a Public Land 
Order with respect to certain lands erro-
neously included in the Cibola National 
Wildlife Refuge, California. 

December 18, 2005: 
H.J. Res. 75. A joint resolution making fur-

ther continuing appropriations for the fiscal 
year 2006, and for other purposes. 

December 20, 2005: 
H.R. 2520. An Act to provide for the collec-

tion and maintenance of human cord blood 
stem cells for the treatment of patients and 
research, and to amend the Public Health 
Service Act to authorize the C.W. Bill Young 
Cell Transplantation Program. 

f 

SENATE BILLS APPROVED BY THE 
PRESIDENT 

The President notified the Clerk of 
the House that on the following dates, 
he had approved and signed bills of the 
Senate of the following titles: 

September 21, 2005. 
S. 252. An Act to direct the Secretary of 

the Interior to convey certain land in 
Washoe County, Nevada, to the Board of Re-
gents of the University and Community Col-
lege System of Nevada. 

S. 264. An Act to amend the Reclamation 
Wastewater and Groundwater Study and Fa-
cilities Act to authorize certain projects in 
the State of Hawaii. 

S. 276. An Act to revise the boundary of the 
Wind Cave National Park in the State of 
South Dakota. 

September 29, 2005: 
S. 1340. An Act to amend the Pittman-Rob-

ertson Wildlife Restoration Act to extend 
the date after which surplus funds in the 
wildlife restoration fund become available 
for apportionment. 

S. 1368. An Act to extend the existence of 
the Parole Commission, and for other pur-
poses. 
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September 30, 2005: 

S. 1752. An Act to amend the United States 
Grain Standards Act to reauthorize that Act. 

October 7, 2005: 
S. 1786. An Act to authorize the Secretary 

of Transportation to make emergency air-
port improvement project grants-in-aid 
under title 49, United States Code, for re-
pairs and costs related to damage from Hur-
ricanes Katrina and Rita. 

S. 1858. An Act to provide for community 
disaster loans. 

October 13, 2005: 
S. 1413. An Act to redesignate the Crowne 

Plaza in Kingston, Jamaica, as the Colin L. 
Powell Residential Plaza. 

October 26, 2005: 
S. 55. An Act to adjust the boundary of 

Rocky Mountain National Park in the State 
of Colorado. 

S. 156. An Act to designate the Ojito Wil-
derness Study Area as wilderness, to take 
certain land into trust for the Pueblo of Zia, 
and for other purposes. 

S. 397. An Act to prohibit civil liability ac-
tions from being brought or continued 
against manufacturers, distributors, dealers, 
or importers of firearms or ammunition for 
damages, injunctive or other relief resulting 
from the misuse of their products by others. 

November 9, 2005: 
S. 172. An Act to amend the Federal Food, 

Drug, and Cosmetic Act to provide for the 
regulation of all contact lenses as medical 
devices, and for other purposes. 

November 11, 2005: 
S. 37. An Act to extend the special postage 

stamp for breast cancer research for 2 years. 
S. 1285. An Act to designate the Federal 

building located at 333 Mt. Elliott Street in 
Detroit, Michigan, as the ‘‘Rosa Parks Fed-
eral Building’’. 

November 22, 2005: 
S. 161. An Act to provide for a land ex-

change in the State of Arizona between the 
Secretary of Agriculture and Yavapai Ranch 
Limited Partnership. 

S. 1234. An Act to increase, effective as of 
December 1, 2005, the rates of compensation 
for veterans with service-connected disabil-
ities and the rates of dependency and indem-
nity compensation for the survivors of cer-
tain disabled veterans. 

S. 1713. An Act to make amendments to the 
Iran Nonproliferation Act to 2000 related to 
International space Station payments, and 
for other purposes. 

S. 1894. An Act to amend part E of title IV 
of the Social Security Act to provide for the 
making of foster care maintenance payments 
to private for-profit agencies. 

December 20, 2005: 
S. 52. An Act to direct the Secretary of the 

Interior to convey a parcel of real property 
to Beaver County, Utah. 

S. 136. An Act to authorize the Secretary of 
the Interior to provide supplemental funding 
and other services that are necessary to as-
sist certain local school districts in the 
State of California in providing educational 
services for students attending schools lo-
cated within Yosemite National Park, to au-
thorize the Secretary of the Interior to ad-
just the boundaries of the Golden Gate Na-
tional Recreation Area, to adjust the bound-
aries of Redwood National Park, and for 
other purposes. 

S. 212. An Act to amend the Valles Caldera 
Preservation Act to improve the preserva-
tion of the Valles Caldera, and for other pur-
poses. 

S. 279. An Act to amend the Act of June 7, 
1924, to provide for the exercise of criminal 
jurisdiction. 

S. 1886. An Act to authorize the transfer of 
naval vessels to certain foreign recipients. 

SENATE BILLS REFERRED 

Bills of the Senate of the following 
titles were taken from the Speaker’s 
table and, under the rule, referred as 
follows: 

S. 119. An act to provide for the protection 
of unaccompanied alien children, and for 
other purposes, to the Committee on the Ju-
diciary. 

S. 716. An act to amend title 38, United 
States Code, to enhance services provided by 
vet centers, to clarify and improve the provi-
sion of bereavement counseling by the De-
partment of Veterans Affairs, and for other 
purposes; to the Committee on Veterans Af-
fairs. 

S. 1182. An act to amend title 38, United 
States Code, to improve health care for vet-
erans, and for other purposes, to the Com-
mittee on Veterans Affairs. 

S. 1184. An act to waive the passport fees 
for a relative of a deceased member of the 
Armed Forces proceeding abroad to visit the 
grave of such member or to attend a funeral 
or memorial service for such member; to the 
Committee on International Relations. 

f 

SENATE ENROLLED BILLS SIGNED 

The SPEAKER pro tempore, Mr. 
WOLF, announced his signature to en-
rolled bills of the Senate of the fol-
lowing titles: 

S. 205. An act to authorize the American 
Battle Monuments Commission to establish 
in the State of Louisiana a memorial to 
honor the Buffalo Soldiers. 

S. 652. An act to provide financial assist-
ance for the rehabilitation of the Benjamin 
Franklin National Memorial in Philadelphia, 
Pennsylvania, and the development of an ex-
hibit to commemorate the 300th anniversary 
of the birth of Benjamin Franklin. 

S. 1238. An act to amend the Public Lands 
Corps Act of 1993 to provide for the conduct 
of projects that protect forests, and for other 
purposes. 

S. 1281. An act to authorize the programs 
of the National Aeronautics and Space Ad-
ministration. 

S. 1310. An act to authorize the Secretary 
of the Interior to allow the Columbia Gas 
Transmission Corporation to increase the di-
ameter of a natural gas pipeline located in 
the Delaware Water Gap National Recreation 
Area, to allow certain commercial vehicles 
to continue to use Route 209 within Delaware 
Water Gap National Recreation Area, and to 
extend the termination date of the National 
Park System Advisory Board to January 1, 
2007. 

S. 1481. An act to amend the Indian Land 
Consolidation act to provide for probate re-
form. 

S. 1892. An act to amend Public Law 107–153 
to modify a certain date. 

S. 1988. An act to authorize the transfer of 
items in the War Reserves Stockpile for Al-
lies, Korea. 

f 

BILLS PRESENTED TO THE 
PRESIDENT 

Karen L. Haas, Clerk of the House, 
reports that on December 17, 2005, she 
presented to the President of the 
United States, for his approval, the fol-
lowing bills. 

H.J. Res. 75. Making further continuing ap-
propriations for the fiscal year 2006, and for 
other purposes. 

H.R. 327. To allow binding arbitration 
clauses to be included in all contracts affect-

ing land within the Gila River Indian Com-
munity Reservation. 

H.R. 4324. To amend the Robert T. Stafford 
Disaster Relief and Emergency Assistance 
Act to reauthorize the predisaster mitiga-
tion program, and for other purposes. 

H.R. 4436. To provide certain authorities 
for the Department of State, and for other 
purposes. 

Karen L. Haas, Clerk of the House, 
also reports that on December 20, 2005, 
she presented to the President of the 
United States, for his approval, the fol-
lowing bills. 

H.J. Res. 38. Recognizing Commodore John 
Barry as the first flag officer of the United 
States Navy. 

H.R. 358. To require the Secretary of the 
Treasury to mint coins in commemoration of 
the 50th anniversary of the desegregation of 
the Little Rock Central High School in Lit-
tle Rock, Arkansas, and for other purposes. 

H.R. 797. To amend the Native American 
Housing Assistance and Self-Determination 
Act of 1996 and other Acts to improve hous-
ing programs for Indians. 

H.R. 2520. To provide for the collection and 
maintenance of human cord blood stem cells 
for the treatment of patients and research, 
and to amend the Public Health Service Act 
to authorize the C.W. Bill Young Cell Trans-
plantation Program. 

H.R. 3963. To amend the Federal Water Pol-
lution Control Act to extend the authoriza-
tion of appropriations for Long Island Sound. 

H.R. 4195. To authorize early repayment of 
obligations to the Bureau of Reclamation 
within Rogue River Valley Irrigation Dis-
trict or within Medford Irrigation District. 

H.R. 4440. To amend the Internal Revenue 
Code of 1986 to provide tax benefits for the 
Gulf Opportunity Zone and certain areas af-
fected by Hurricanes Rita and Wilma, and for 
other purposes. 

H.R. 4508. To commend the outstanding ef-
forts in response to Hurricane Katrina by 
members and employees of the Coast Guard, 
to provide temporary relief to certain per-
sons affected by such hurricane with respect 
to certain laws administered by the Coast 
Guard, and for other purposes. 

f 

SINE DIE ADJOURNMENT 

Mr. SENSENBRENNER. Mr. Speak-
er, pursuant to the order of the House 
of today, I move that the House do now 
adjourn. 

The motion was agreed to. 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. Accord-

ingly, pursuant to the previous order of 
the House of today, the House stands 
adjourned until 11 a.m. on Monday, De-
cember 26, 2005, unless it sooner has re-
ceived a message or messages from the 
Senate transmitting its adoption of 
House Concurrent Resolution 326, in 
which case the House shall stand ad-
journed sine die pursuant to House 
Concurrent Resolution 326. 

Thereupon (at 4 o’clock and 36 min-
utes p.m.), pursuant to the previous 
order of the House of today, the House 
adjourned until 11 a.m. on Monday, De-
cember 26, 2005, unless it sooner has re-
ceived a message or messages from the 
Senate transmitting its adoption of 
House Concurrent Resolution 326, in 
which case the House shall stand ad-
journed sine die pursuant to House 
Concurrent Resolution 326. 
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